



State of New York
County of Broome Government Offices

Division of Purchasing

Jason T. Garnar, County Executive · Tyler B. West, Director

Notice of Bid Award

November 28, 2017

Whom It May Concern,

This shall advise you that on November 8, 2017, the Board of Acquisition and Contract approved the following:

Bid Title: Purchase of Snow Plow Blades, Shoes, and Salt Spreader Chains
Bid #: 2017-089
CA #: 11-2310
Term: 11/15/2017 – 04/30/2018
Amount: Per Attached

Purchase order(s) will be forthcoming upon receipt of a certificate of insurance in compliance with the insurance requirements as stated in the specifications. **Incorrect insurance certificates will cause delays in payment.**

If you have not submitted the proper insurance certificate, please send a copy to Thomas Dellapenna, Risk Manager, Broome County Office of Risk Management, County Office Building, 3rd Floor, 60 Hawley Street, P.O. Box 1766, Binghamton, NY 13902-1766. Phone: (607) 778-2402 Fax #: (607) 778-6009
IMPORTANT: Please include the bid title and bid number on the insurance certificate.

Very truly yours,

Tyler West
Director

cc: Susan Brown, Highway
Jeanne Bourque, Risk
Purchasing, Bid File

Plow Blades – Shoes – Salt Spreader Chains

Awarded Vendors

American Material Processing
PO Box 643
Newark, NY 14513
Phone: 315-318-0017
Fax: 315-318-0018
Email: lawson@americanmaterialprocessing.com

Chemung Supply Corp.
PO Box 527
Elmira, NY 14902
Phone: 607-733-5506
Fax: 607-732-5379
Email: gwilber@chemungsupply.com

Expanded Supply Products, Inc.
3330 Route 9
Cold Spring, NY 10516
Phone: 845-265-3771
Fax: 845-265-3772
Email: ESPInvoice@gmail.com

Steel Sales, Inc.
8085 State Highway 12
Sherburne, NY 13460
Phone: 607-674-6363
Fax: 607-674-9706
Email: Pat@steelsalesinc.com

Wear Parts & Equipment Co., Inc.
20100 E. 35th Drive
Aurora, CO 80011
Phone: 303-287-1966
Fax: 303-288-2204
Email: ian@wearpartsc.com

RFB-2017-089
Plow Blades - Shoes - Salt Spreader Chains

Item #	Description	Award			
1	Steel Snow Plow Blade Edges: 1" x 8" x 5' Surface hardened or flame hardened Only – 7 hole – reversible – punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3" – 3" – 12" centers – Pacal #P8849501 or equal	1st Low	Steel Sales	\$77.95	Esco SB60550
		2nd Low	Chemung Supply	\$94.69	Evolution Edges EPBTPSCA-20902
		3rd Low	Expanded Supply Products	\$130.68	Valk ESP185
2	Steel Snow Plow Blade Edges: 1" x 8" x 6' Surface hardened or flame hardened Only – 8 hole – reversible – punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3" – 3" – 12" centers – Pacal #P8849601 or equal	1st Low	Chemung Supply	\$113.64	Evolution Edges EPBTPSCA-20903
		2nd Low	Steel Sales	\$131.95	Esco SB60634
		3rd Low	American Material Processing	\$139.00	Amp AMP8849601
		4th Low	Expanded Supply Products	\$157.64	Valk ESP186
3	Carbide Insert Blade: 3/4" x 6" x 4' -6 hole – punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3" – 3" – 12" centers 1-1/2" Gauge	1st Low	Steel Sales	\$155.00	PNS CB15083
		2nd Low	Expanded Supply Products	\$163.64	Valk ESP3/464
		3rd Low	Chemung Supply	\$168.95	Evolution Edges ECBTPSQA-22480
		4th Low	Wear Parts & Equipment	\$179.26	Black Cat CIAT664844
4	Carbide Insert Blade: 3/4" x 6" x 3' -5 hole - punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3" – 3" – 12" centers 1-1/2" gauge	1st Low	Steel Sales	\$116.00	PNS CB15082
		2nd Low	Expanded Supply Products	\$122.73	Valk ESP3/463
		3rd Low	Chemung Supply	\$126.72	Evolution Edges ECBTPSQA-22360
		4th Low	Wear Parts & Equipment	\$134.59	Black Cat CIAT663644
5	Spreader Chains: pintle link: 667X, bar flight: 3/8" x 1 1/2", bar flight location: every other link, bar flight to be double welded at each end	1st Low	American Material Processing	\$23.70	(Price Per Foot) <u>Widths:</u> a. 20 1/2" center to center: b. 21" center to center: c. 21 1/16" center to center: d. 21 1/4" center to center:
		2nd Low	Expanded Supply Products	\$23.75	
		3rd Low	Steel Sales	\$24.50	
		4th Low	Chemung Supply	\$25.50	
6	Spreader Chains: pintle link: D88K, bar flight: 3/8" x 1 1/2" bar flight location: every other link bar flight to be double welded at each end	1st Low	Expanded Supply Products	\$26.32	(Price Per Foot) <u>Widths:</u> 20" center to center:
		2nd Low	Chemung Supply	\$26.95	
		3rd Low	Steel Sales	\$29.50	
7	Snow Plow Shoes: Moldboard	Award TBD by Highway Dept by Item at time of Order	Chemung Supply	20% - See Attached	State Percentage: _____ %
8	Snow Plow Shoes: Wing Shoe (8 & 12: combo centers) Moldboard		Steel Sales	See Attached	
9	Frame Shoe-one way		Expanded Supply	0 % DISCOUNT	
10	Nosepiece		Wear Parts & Equipment	30.5% - See Attached	

CHEMUNG SUPPLY

BROOME COUNTY
DIVISION OF PURCHASING
PROPOSAL SHEET

Item #	Description	Est. Qty. Needed	Unit / Each Price
1.	Steel Snow Plow Blade Edges: 1" x 8" x 5' Surface hardened or flame hardened Only - 7 hole - reversible - punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3" - 3" - 12" centers - Pacal #P8849501 or equal Grade 1084 HR steel - brinell hardness range 277-331 Equivalent Manufacturer: <u>Evolution Edges</u> Part # <u>EPBCPSCA20902</u>	50	\$ <u>94.69</u>
2.	Steel Snow Plow Blade Edges: 1" x 8" x 6' Surface hardened or flame hardened Only - 8 hole - reversible - punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3" - 3" - 12" centers - Pacal #P8849601 or equal Grade 1084 HR steel - Brinell hardness range 277-331 Equivalent Manufacturer: <u>Evolution Edges</u> Part # <u>EPBCPSCA-20903</u>	50	\$ <u>113.64</u>
3.	Carbide Insert Blade: 3/4" x 6" x 4' - 6 hole - punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3" - 3" - 12" centers - 1-1/2" gauge Manufacturer <u>Evolution Edges</u> Part # <u>ECBTPSQA-22480</u>	75	\$ <u>168.95</u>
4.	Carbide Insert Blade: 3/4" x 6" x 3' - 5 hole - punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3" - 3" - 12" centers - 1-1/2" gauge Manufacturer: <u>Evolution Edges</u> Part # <u>ECBTPSQA-22360</u>	75	\$ <u>126.72</u>
5.	Spreader Chains: pintle link: 667X, bar flight: 3/8" x 1 1/2", bar flight location: every other link, bar flight to be double welded at each end Widths: a. 20 1/2" center to center: b. 21" center to center: c. 21 1/16" center to center: d. 21 1/4" center to center:	Price Per foot	\$ <u>25.50</u> \$ <u>25.50</u> \$ <u>25.50</u> \$ <u>25.50</u>
6.	Spreader Chains: pintle link: D88K, bar flight: 3/8" x 1 1/2", bar flight location: every other link, bar flight to be double welded at each end Widths: 20" center to center:	Price Per foot	\$ <u>26.95</u>
7.	Snow Plow Shoes: Moldboard OST610/60 list \$73.75	75	Attach price list if offering discount from list State Percentage 20 %
8.	Snow Plow Shoes: Wing Shoe (8 & 12: combo centers) Moldboard OST400 list \$72.95	100	
9.	Frame Shoe - one way OST900 list \$102.70	150	
10.	Nosepiece OST730H list \$28.06	100	

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET AND AN EXACT, CLEAR DUPLICATE.

STEEL SALES

BROOME COUNTY DIVISION OF PURCHASING PROPOSAL SHEET

Item #	Description	Est. Qty. Needed	Unit / Each Price
1.	Steel Snow Plow Blade Edges: 1" x 8" x 5' Surface hardened or flame hardened Only - 7 hole - reversible - punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3" - 3" - 12" centers - Pacal #P8849501 or equal Equivalent Manufacturer: <u>ESCO</u> Part # <u>SB60550</u>	50	\$ <u>77.95</u>
2.	Steel Snow Plow Blade Edges: 1" x 8" x 6' Surface hardened or flame hardened Only - 8 hole - reversible - punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3" - 3" - 12" centers - Pacal #P8849601 or equal Equivalent Manufacturer: <u>ESCO</u> Part # <u>SB60634</u>	50	\$ <u>131.95</u>
3.	Carbide Insert Blade: 3/4" x 6" x 4' - 6 hole - punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3" - 3" - 12" centers - 1-1/2" gauge Manufacturer: <u>PNS</u> Part # <u>CB15083</u>	75	\$ <u>155.00</u>
4.	Carbide Insert Blade: 3/4" x 6" x 3' - 5 hole - punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3" - 3" - 12" centers - 1-1/2" gauge Manufacturer: <u>PNS</u> Part # <u>CB15082</u>	75	\$ <u>116.00</u>
5.	Spreader Chains: pintle link: 667X, bar flight: 3/8" x 1 1/2", bar flight location: every other link, bar flight to be double welded at each end Widths: a. 20 1/2" center to center: b. 21" center to center: c. 21 1/16" center to center: d. 21 1/4" center to center:	Price Per foot	\$ <u>24.50</u> \$ <u>24.50</u> \$ <u>24.50</u> \$ <u>24.50</u>
6.	Spreader Chains: pintle link: D88K, bar flight: 3/8" x 1 1/2", bar flight location: every other link, bar flight to be double welded at each end Widths: 20" center to center:	Price Per foot	\$ <u>29.50</u>
7.	Snow Plow Shoes: Moldboard	75	Attach price list if offering discount from list.
8.	Snow Plow Shoes: Wing Shoe (8 & 12: combo centers) Moldboard	100	
9.	Frame Shoe - one way	150	State Percentage %
10.	Nosepiece	100	

SEE ATTACHED LIST

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET AND AN EXACT, CLEAR DUPLICATE.



Effective	12/19/2016	<u>Steel Plow Accessories</u>	Page	E-5
Replaces	2/4/2014			
SSIS100		100 Steel Frame Shoe Adapter 4" x 10" Shaft Viking Pre 2001	\$85.00	EA +
SSIS100N		100N Steel Frame Shoe Adapter 3" x 10" Shaft Viking Post2000	\$85.00	EA +
SSIS110		110 Steel Frame Shoe Adapter 3" x 15" Shaft Tenco	\$138.00	EA +
SSIS120		120 Steel Frame Shoe Adapter 3" x 15" Frink/Everest	\$110.00	EA +
SSIS400		400 Steel Wing Shoe 8" and 12" Centers	\$48.00	EA
SSIS410		400 10 Degree Steel Wing Shoe 8" and 12" Centers	\$48.00	EA
SSIS415		400 15 Degree Steel Wing Shoe 8" and 12" Centers	\$48.00	EA
SSIS420		400 20 Degree Steel Wing Shoe 8" and 12" Centers	\$48.00	EA
SSIS425		400 25 Degree Steel Wing Shoe 8" and 12" Centers	\$48.00	EA
SSIS2400		2400 Steel Wing Shoe 8" TP, 8" and 12" Centers	\$85.00	EA
SSIS2410		2410 Steel Wing Shoe 8" TP, 8" and 12" Centers	\$85.00	EA
SSIS600		600 Steel Moldboard Shoe 3/4" Base, 45 Degree, 8" and 12" Centers	\$35.00	EA
SSIS605		605 Steel Moldboard Shoe 1" Base, 45 Degree, 8" and 12" Centers	\$39.00	EA
SSIS610		610 Steel Moldboard Shoe 1 1/4" Base, 45 Degree, 8" and 12" Centers	\$41.00	EA
SSIS610-60		610-60 Steel Moldboard Shoe 1 1/4" Base, 60 Degree, 8" and 12" Centers	\$44.00	EA
SSIS620		620 Steel Moldboard Shoe "Tootsie Roll" 8" and 12" Centers	\$39.00	EA
SSIS645		645 Steel Moldboard Shoe HD 1 1/4" Base 8" Centers	\$49.00	EA
SSIS650		650 Steel Moldboard Shoe 8" Centers	\$45.00	EA
SSIS2600		2600 Steel Moldboard Shoe 8" TP, 8" and 12" Centers	\$69.00	EA
SSIS700		700 Steel Nosepiece Frink, 8" CP	\$39.00	EA
SSIS750		750 Steel Nosepiece Frink, 8" TP	\$39.00	EA
SSIS780		780 Steel Nosepiece LaRoche	\$39.00	EA
SSIS800		800 Steel Nosepiece Viking CP	\$39.00	EA
SSIS800N		800N Steel Nosepiece Viking CP	\$39.00	EA
SSIS840		840 Steel Nosepiece Viking CP	\$39.00	EA
SSIS850-6		850-6 Steel Nosepiece Viking 6" TP	\$39.00	EA
SSIS850-8		850-8 Steel Nosepiece Viking 8" TP	\$39.00	EA
SSIS880		880 Steel Nosepiece Everest	\$39.00	EA
SSIS891		891 Steel Nosepiece 8" CP Henderson	\$39.00	EA
SSIS892		892 Steel Nosepiece 8" TP Henderson	\$39.00	EA
SSIS900		900 Steel Frame Shoe	\$59.00	EA
SSIS910		910 Steel Frame "Boat" Shoe	\$89.00	EA
SSIS16		16 Steel Curb Guard	\$34.00	EA
SSIS1500		1500 Steel Curb Guard	\$39.00	EA
SSIS1510		1510 Steel Curb Guard	\$39.00	EA
SSIS1550S		1550S Steel Curb Guard	\$49.00	EA

Due to the constant price fluctuations in the steel market, prices are subject to change without notice.



Effective Replaces	10/10/2017 6/20/2014	Plow Accessories	Page	E-5A
SSIC2		SSIC2 Cast Frame Shoe 1 1/2"	\$40.00	EA
SSIC3		SSIC3-12 Cast Wing Shoe 6" TP, 8" Centers	\$54.00	EA +
SSIC4		SSIC4 Cast Wing Shoe 8"CP, 8" Centers	\$38.00	EA +
SSIC5		SSIC5 Cast Frame "Boat" Shoe	\$60.00	EA
SSIC6		SSIC6 Cast Fisher Plow Shoe 1 3/8" x 5 1/4" Shaft, 6" Base	\$31.00	EA +
SSIC7		SSIC7 Cast Fisher Plow Shoe 1 3/8" x 5" Shaft, 7" Base	\$33.00	EA -
SSIC8		28E Cast Moldboard Shoe, 8" CP, 8" Centers	\$41.00	EA +
SSIC10		SSIC10 Cast Mushroom Frame Shoe	\$57.00	EA -
SSIC11		SSIC11 Cast Plow Shoe	\$53.00	EA
SSIC12		SSIC12 Cast Wing Shoe 8" CP, 12" Centers	\$53.00	EA +
SSIC18		SSIC18 Cast Diamond Plow Shoe 1" x 3 1/2" Shaft, 6" x 6" Base	\$16.00	EA
SSIC20		1582-AM Cast Western Pick Up	\$28.00	EA
SSIC22		SSIC22 Cast Wing Shoe 8" TP, 8" Centers	\$65.00	EA +
SSIC23		SSIC23 Cast Wing Shoe 8" TP, 12" Centers	\$64.00	EA +
SSIC24		L-RP-4 Cast Frink Roll Over Plow Shoe 8" CP, 8" Centers	\$63.00	EA -
SSIC25		SSIC25 Forged Small Ballfoot 1 1/2"	\$15.00	EA -
SSIC26		SSIC26 Cast Wing Shoe 8" CP, 12" Centers	\$40.00	EA +
SSIC27		SSIC27 Forged Large Ballfoot 2 7/8" 5 lbs.	\$30.00	EA -
SSIC29		*** SSIC29 Cast Moldboard Shoe 8" TP, 12" Centers	\$59.00	EA Disc
SSIC30		RV 600 8X70 Cast Wing & Moldboard Shoe Everest/Tenco, 8" Centers	\$28.00	EA -
SSIC32		SSIC32 Cast Wing & Moldboard Shoe Everest/Tenco, 12" Centers	\$38.00	EA
SSIC34		SSIC34 Cast Wing & Moldboard Shoe Tenco 8" CP	\$30.00	EA +
SSIC43		SSIC43 Cast HD Wing Shoe 6" or 8" CP	\$69.00	EA +
SSIC4189		***4189 Cast Wing Shoe	\$35.00	EA Disc
SSIC4350		4350 Cast Moldboard 8"CP 8" Centers	\$48.00	EA -
SSICNH5		4242-N-H Ni-Hard Carbide Cast Boat Shoe 44lbs	\$110.00	EA -
SSICNH10		10NH3 Ni Hard Carbide Cast Mushroom Frame Shoe 61 lbs	\$130.00	EA -
SSICNH43		43NH Ni-Hard Carbide Cast Wing Shoe 62 lbs.	\$130.00	EA +

BROOME COUNTY
DIVISION OF PURCHASING
PROPOSAL SHEET

Item #	Description	Est. Qty. Needed	Unit / Each Price
1.	Steel Snow Plow Blade Edges: 1" x 8" x 5' Surface hardened or flame hardened Only - 7 hole - reversible - punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3" - 3" - 12" centers - Pacal #P8849501 or equal Equivalent Manufacturer: _____ Part # _____	50	\$ <u>NB</u>
2.	Steel Snow Plow Blade Edges: 1" x 8" x 6' Surface hardened or flame hardened Only - 8 hole - reversible - punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3" - 3" - 12" centers - Pacal #P8849601 or equal Equivalent Manufacturer: <u>AMP</u> Part # <u>AMP8849601</u>	50	\$ <u>139.00</u>
3.	Carbide Insert Blade: 3/4" x 6" x 4'-6 hole - punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3" - 3" - 12" centers - 1-1/2" gauge Manufacturer: _____ Part # _____	75	\$ <u>NB</u>
4.	Carbide Insert Blade: 3/4"x6"x3'-5 hole-punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3"-3"-12" centers - 1-1/2" gauge Manufacturer: _____ Part # _____	75	\$ <u>NB</u>
5.	Spreader Chains: pintle link: 667X, bar flight: 3/8"x1 1/2", bar flight location: every other link, bar flight to be double welded at each end Widths: a. 20 1/2" center to center: b. 21" center to center: c. 21 1/16" center to center: d. 21 1/4" center to center:	Price Per foot	\$ <u>23.70</u> \$ <u>23.70</u> \$ <u>23.70</u> \$ <u>23.70</u>
6.	Spreader Chains: pintle link:D88K, bar flight: 3/8"x1 1/2", bar flight location: every other link, bar flight to be double welded at each end Widths: 20" center to center:	Price Per foot	\$ <u>NB</u>
7.	Snow Plow Shoes: Moldboard	75	Attach price list if offering discount from list.
8.	Snow Plow Shoes: Wing Shoe (8 & 12: combo centers)Moldboard	100	
9.	Frame Shoe-one way	150	State Percentage _____ %
10.	Nosepiece	100	

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET AND AN EXACT, CLEAR DUPLICATE.

EXPANDED SUPPLY PRODUCTS

BROOME COUNTY DIVISION OF PURCHASING PROPOSAL SHEET

Item #	Description	Est. Qty. Needed	Unit / Each Price
1.	Steel Snow Plow Blade Edges: 1" x 8" x 5' Surface hardened or flame hardened Only - 7 hole - reversible - punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3" - 3" - 12" centers - Pacal #P8849501 or equal Equivalent Manufacturer: <u>Valk</u> Part # <u>ESP185</u>	50	\$ <u>130.68</u>
2.	Steel Snow Plow Blade Edges: 1" x 8" x 6' Surface hardened or flame hardened Only - 8 hole - reversible - punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3" - 3" - 12" centers - Pacal #P8849601 or equal Equivalent Manufacturer: <u>Valk</u> Part # <u>ESP186</u>	50	\$ <u>157.64</u>
3.	Carbide Insert Blade: 3/4" x 6" x 4'-6 hole - punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3" - 3" - 12" centers - 1-1/2" gauge Manufacturer: <u>Valk</u> Part # <u>ESP 3/4 64</u>	75	\$ <u>163.64</u>
4.	Carbide Insert Blade: 3/4" x 6" x 3' - 5 hole - punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3" - 3" - 12" centers - 1-1/2" gauge Manufacturer: <u>Valk</u> Part # <u>ESP 3/4 63</u>	75	\$ <u>122.73</u>
5.	Spreader Chains: pintle link: 667X, bar flight: 3/8" x 1 1/2", bar flight location: every other link, bar flight to be double welded at each end Widths:		
	a. 20 1/2" center to center:	Price Per foot	\$ <u>23.75</u>
	b. 21" center to center:	Price Per foot	\$ <u>23.75</u>
	c. 21 1/16" center to center:	Price Per foot	\$ <u>23.75</u>
	d. 21 1/4" center to center:	Price Per foot	\$ <u>23.75</u>
6.	Spreader Chains: pintle link: D88K, bar flight: 3/8" x 1 1/2", bar flight location: every other link, bar flight to be double welded at each end Widths: 20" center to center:	Price Per foot	\$ <u>26.32</u>
7.	Snow Plow Shoes: Moldboard	75	Attach price list if offering discount from list. State Percentage <u>0</u> %
8.	Snow Plow Shoes: Wing Shoe (8 & 12: combo centers) Moldboard	100	
9.	Frame Shoe - one way	150	
10.	Nosepiece	100	

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET AND AN EXACT, CLEAR DUPLICATE.

BROOME COUNTY
DIVISION OF PURCHASING
PROPOSAL SHEET

Item #	Description	Est. Qty. Needed	Unit / Each Price
1.	Steel Snow Plow Blade Edges: 1" x 8" x 5' Surface hardened or flame hardened Only – 7 hole – reversible – punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3" – 3" – 12" centers – Pacal #P8849501 or equal Equivalent Manufacturer: <u>Black Cat</u> Part # <u>PBB8806049</u>	50	\$ <u>107.50</u>
2.	Steel Snow Plow Blade Edges: 1" x 8" x 6' Surface hardened or flame hardened Only – 8 hole – reversible – punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3" – 3" – 12" centers – Pacal #P8849601 or equal Equivalent Manufacturer: <u>Black Cat</u> Part # <u>PBB8807249</u>	50	\$ <u>128.87</u>
3.	Carbide Insert Blade: 3/4" x 6" x 4' -6 hole – punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3" – 3" – 12" centers – 1-1/2" gauge Manufacturer: <u>Black Cat</u> Part # <u>CIAT664844</u>	75	\$ <u>179.26</u>
4.	Carbide Insert Blade: 3/4" x 6" x 3' -5 hole-punched for 5/8" plow bolts on 3"-3"-12" centers – 1-1/2" gauge Manufacturer: <u>Black Cat</u> Part # <u>CIAT663644</u>	75	\$ <u>134.59</u>
5.	Spreader Chains: pintle link: 667X, bar flight: 3/8"x1 1/2", bar flight location: every other link, bar flight to be double welded at each end Widths: a. 20 1/2" center to center: b. 21" center to center: c. 21 1/16" center to center: d. 21 1/4" center to center:	Price Per foot	\$ <u>No Bid</u> \$ <u>No Bid.</u> \$ <u>No Bid.</u> \$ <u>No Bid.</u>
6.	Spreader Chains: pintle link:D88K, bar flight: 3/8"x1 1/2", bar flight location: every other link, bar flight to be double welded at each end Widths: 20" center to center:	Price Per foot	\$ <u>No Bid.</u>
7.	Snow Plow Shoes: Moldboard	75	Attach price list if offering discount from list.
8.	Snow Plow Shoes: Wing Shoe (8 & 12: combo centers)Moldboard	100	
9.	Frame Shoe-one way	150	State Percentage <u>30.5</u> %
10.	Nosepiece	100	

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET AND AN EXACT, CLEAR DUPLICATE.



WEAR PARTS & EQUIP CO., INC.
 P.O. BOX 472617
 AURORA, CO 80047-2617
 (303) 287-1966
 FAX(303) 288-2204
 WWW.WEARPARTSCO.COM

Quote

Customer No.: BROOME CNTY
 Quote No.: 81254

Quote To: **BROOME COUNTY**
 60 HAWLEY ST, 4TH FLOOR
 EDWIN L CRAWFORD COUNTY OFFICE BLDG
 BINGHAMTON, NY 13901

Ship To: **BROOME COUNTY**
 HIGHWAY GARAGE
 47 THOMAS ST
 CHENANGO BRIDGE, NY 13901

Date	Ship Via	F.O.B.	Terms
10/17/17	FREIGHT	Origin	Net 21
Purchase Order Number	Sales Person		Expires
	OFFICE		11/16/17
Quantity			Amount
Required	Shipped	B.O.	

Quantity	Item Number	Description	Unit Price	Amount
	RFB-2017-089	**ALL QUOTED PARTS ARE MANUFACTURED BY BLACK CAT WEAR PARTS.		
50	BCBIDPBB8806049	1X8X60 5/8P CENTER PUNCH FLAME HARDENED PLOW BLADE	107.50	5375.00
50	BCBIDPBB8807249	1X8X72 5/8P CENTER PUNCH FLAME HARDENED PLOW BLADE	128.87	6443.50
		ABOVE TWO LINE ITEMS 4 WEEKS LEAD TIME =====		
75	BCBIDCIAT664844	3/4X6X48 CARBIDE INSERTED PLOW BLADE	179.26	13444.50
75	BCBIDCIAT663644	3/4X6X36 CARBIDE INSERTED PLOW BLADE	134.59	10094.25
		=====		
		PLOW SHOES PRICE LIST:		
75	BCBID600A70X12	ALLOY MOLDBOARD/WING SHOE 70DG 12"	53.32	3999.00
		**NOTE: WING SHOES OFFERED IN BOTH 8" AND 12" CENTERS AS SEPARATE ITEMS BELOW		
50	BCBID600G70X8	GREY IRON WING SHOE 70DG 8"	24.46	1223.00
50	BCBID600A70X12	ALLOY MOLDBOARD/WING SHOE 70DG 12"	53.32	2666.00
100	BCBID541R		22.26	2226.00

PLEASE VISIT US AT WWW.WEARPARTSCO.COM



WEAR PARTS & EQUIP CO., INC.
 P.O. BOX 472617
 AURORA, CO 80047-2617
 (303) 287-1966
 FAX(303) 288-2204
 WWW.WEARPARTSCO.COM

Quote

Customer No.: BROOME CNTY
 Quote No.: 81254

Quote To: **BROOME COUNTY**
 60 HAWLEY ST, 4TH FLOOR
 EDWIN L CRAWFORD COUNTY OFFICE BLDG
 BINGHAMTON, NY 13901

Ship To: **BROOME COUNTY**
 HIGHWAY GARAGE
 47 THOMAS ST
 CHENANGO BRIDGE, NY 13901

Date	Ship Via	F.O.B.	Terms			
10/17/17	FREIGHT	Origin	Net 21			
Purchase Order Number	Sales Person		Expires			
	OFFICE		11/16/17			
Quantity			Item Number	Description	Unit Price	Amount
Required	Shipped	B.O.				

CAST NOSE SHOE

ABOVE PARTS IN STOCK AT
 MANUFACTURER

150

BCBID605-42
 GREY IRON FRAME SHOE
 ONE-WAY 7" HT250

47.37

7105.50

ABOVE PART HAS QTY: 111
 IN STOCK AT MANUFACTURER,
 90-130 DAYS LEAD TIME FOR

* REMAINDER.

=====

PARTS SHIP FREE FREIGHT.
 **ALL DRAWINGS MUST BE
 APPROVED PRIOR TO ORDERING.

QUOTED TO BROOME COUNTY
 ITH

Quote subtotal 52576.75

Quote total 52576.75