



Broome County Division of Purchasing

Debra A. Preston, County Executive . John A. Flynn, Jr., Director of Purchasing

NOTICE OF VARIOUS BID AWARDS

August 27, 2015

To Whom It May Concern:

This shall advise you that on August 26, 2015 the Board of Acquisition and Contract accepted your bids of July 29, 2015 for furnishing the following to Broome County:

BID #: 2015-072
CA #: 1618
BID TITLE: Groceries & Selected Meats/Fish
AMOUNT: Various
TERM: 9/1/2015 – 12/31/2015

Purchase order(s) will be forthcoming upon receipt of a certificate of insurance in compliance with the insurance requirements as stated in the specifications. **Incorrect insurance certificates will cause delays in payment.**

If you have not submitted the proper insurance certificate, please send/fax a copy to Tom Dellapenna, Risk Manager, Broome County Office of Risk Management, County Office Building, 3rd Floor, 60 Hawley Street, P.O. Box 1766, Binghamton, NY 13902-1766. Phone: (607) 778-2402 Fax #: (607) 778-6009.

IMPORTANT: Please include the bid title and bid number on the insurance certificate.

If you have any questions concerning this award, please telephone the Director of Central Foods at (607) 785-9567.

Very truly yours,

John A. Flynn, Jr.
Director

JAF:ksu

Broome County Office Building . 60 Hawley Street . P.O. Box 1766 . Binghamton, New York 13902
Phone: (607) 778-2188 . Fax: (607) 778-2346 . www.gobroomecounty.com

Awarded Vendors:

Bernard Food Industries, Inc.
P.O. Box 1497
Evanston, IL 60204
Phone: 800 323-3663
Fax #: 800 962-1546
ron@bernardfoods.com

Ginsberg's Institutional Foods, Inc.
P. O. Box 17, Route 66
Hudson, NY 12534
Phone: 518 828-4004, Ext. 250
800 #: 999-6006
Fax #: 518 828-8728
msmith@ginsbergsfoods.com

Good Source Solutions, Inc.
3115 Melrose Drive
Suite 160
Carlsbad, CA 92010
Phone: 760 448-8225
dbrown@goodsource.com

National Food Group
46820 Magellan Dr Ste A
Novi, MI 42377
Phone: 800-886-6866
Fax: 248-669-300
rmccoy@nationalfoodgroup.com

Reinhart Foodservice LLC
100 Industrial Park Road
Coal Township, PA 17866
Phone: 800-332-8598
Fax #: 570-644-2119
pahackman@rfsdelivers.com

US Foods
755 Pierce Road
Clifton Park, NY 12065
Phone: 518 877-3958
800 #: 732-1732
Fax #: 518 877-3944
gabiella.weaver@usfoods.com

Tuna and other Fish Products--Canned or Frozen <290 mg sodium per serving - no added salt.

4 month est qty	Requested pack size	Brand/Label Proposed	Proposed Size/Case Pack	Vendor Cost	Vendor Item Number	Vendor Name
30 CS	200 CT	MONARCH	200/75 OZ	18.10	4969739	US Foods
PEANUT BUTTER, PC'S, <= 290 mg sodium/serving						
20 CS	6/#10 CN	Classic	6/#10			SYSCO
BEETS WHOLE BABY U.S. GRADE A						
2 CS	4/1 GAL	Classic	4/1 gallon			SYSCO
DRESSING 1000 ISL, FAT FR HELLMANN'S OR=						
10 CS	200/CS	Kraft	100/cs			SYSCO
DRESSING 1000 ISLAND PC CUPS						
20 CS	200 CT					SYSCO
DRESSING, FRENCH PC CUPS						
4 CS	6/#10	Classic	6/#10		3264587	SYSCO
CREAMED CHIPPED BEEF -CHEF MATE OR =						
3 CS	2000 CT		2000 ct	0.00		SYSCO
SALT SUBSTITUTE PCS						
5 CS	100/1.76 OZ			no bid		REINHART
SNACK FRENCH TOAST CINNAMANIA						
5 CS	104/1.5 OZ			no bid		REINHART
SNACK MIX MORNING MIXUPS						
1000#	10# CS			no bid		REINHART
DICED BEEF PRODUCT-FULLY COOKED-FROZEN						
40 CS	160/3 OZ			no bid		REINHART
CHICKEN RIBLET BBQ FULLY CKD BONELESS						
5 CS	80/2.6 OZ			no bid		REINHART
POLLOCK UNBREADED GRADE A WEDGE- HIGH LINER OR =						
20 CS	50/3.2 OZ			no bid		REINHART
SALMON BOAT STUFFED-3.2 OZ READY TO COOK						
4 CS	12/51 OZ	HARVEST VL	12/51 OZ	\$82.46	9328303	US Foods
CLAMS CHOPPED						
3 CS	48/6 oz	Classic	24/6 oz	36.56	8524282	SYSCO
TUNA WATER PCK-LT INDIVIDUAL						
60 CS	6/66.5	port royal		\$39.37	42590	ginsbergs
TUNA WATER PCK-LT must be <= 290 mg sodium/serving, prefer <= 140 mg						
30 CS	6/66.5 OZ	rdgreen/mon	6/66.5 OZ	\$	8346892	US Foods
TUNA WHITE TONGOL/WATER must be <= 290 mg sodium/serving, prefer <= 140 mg						
40 CS	6/#10	port royal		\$28.56	43085	ginsbergs
APPLE SLICES US GRADE B WATER PAK no added sugar, no HF corn syrup, no added sodium						
225 CS	6/#10 CN	applesnax		\$17.10	26290	ginsbergs
APPLESAUCE SMOOTH-US GRADE B unsweetened no added sugar, no HF corn syrup, no added sodium						
5 CS	24/303	MUSSELMAN	8/46 OZ	22.81	2255313	US Foods
APPLESAUCE-JP DELMONTE OR EQUAL unsweetened no added sugar, no HF corn syrup, no added sodium						
30 CS	72/4 OZ	MONARCH	72/4 OZ	\$	5790316	US Foods
APPLESAUCE-SHELF STABLE-IND PORTION unsweetened no added sugar, no HF corn syrup, no added sodium						
20 CS	6/#10 CN	port royal		\$35.39	43400	ginsbergs
APRICOT HALVES UNP US GRADE B water/juice pak no added sugar, no added sodium						
1 CS	4/1 GAL	admiration		\$44.40	5740	ginsbergs
CHERRY HALVES, MARACHINO, RED FANCY water/juice pak low sugar, no HF corn syrup, no added sodium						
10 CS	200 CT	Ocean Spray	200 ct	22.66	9278136	SYSCO
CRANBERRY SAUCE, JELLIED-PC PULL TAB/TUB						

CRANBERRY SAUCE-JELLIED US GRADE A Low sugar, No artificial sweetener, Low sodium	8 CS	6#10 CN	ruby kist	\$34.45	43620	2	ginsbergs
CRANBERRY SAUCE-WHOLE-US GRADE A FANCY Low sugar, No artificial sweetener, Low sodium	2 CS	6#10 CN	BHRVST	\$40.86	10770	2	REINHART
FRUIT CUP, DICED MIX-JUICE PACK IND. CUP	10 CS	48/4 OZ	sysco classic	24.76	9705047	2	SYSCO
FRUIT MIX TROPICAL-DELMONTE OR EQUAL	75 CS	6#10 CN	Packer	31.58	4744767	2	SYSCO
FRUIT MIX-U.S. GRADE B water/juice pak no added sugar, no added sodium	90 CS	6#10	port royal	\$32.85	43785	2	ginsbergs
MANDARIN ORANGE WHOLE SEGMENTS-RW	10 CS	6#10 CN	packer	22.04	1009208	2	SYSCO
PEACH SLICES-U.S. GRADE B (CHOICE) water/juice pak no added sugar, no added sodium	85 CS	6#10	port royal	\$31.65	44530	2	ginsbergs
PEACHES, DICED-U.S. GRADE B (CHOICE)	10 CS	48/4 OZ	sysco classic	24.78	2603013	2	SYSCO
PEACHES, DICED-U.S. GRADE B (CHOICE) water/juice pak no added sugar, no added sodium	130 CS	6#10	ambrosia	\$28.20	44535	2	ginsbergs
PEACHES, DICED-U.S. GRADE B (CHOICE) water/juice pak no added sugar, no added sodium individual	10 CS	48/4 OZ	DOLE	\$19.01	89816	2	REINHART
PEARS SLICES, BARTLETT-PEELED US GRADE B	40 CS	6#10	Premium	29.91	8538352	2	SYSCO
PEARS, DICED, BARTLETT-PEELED US GRD B water/juice pak no added sugar, no added sodium	90 CS	6#10 CN	port royal	\$28.84	44740	2	ginsbergs
PINEAPPLE CHUNK JP US GRADE B water/juice pak no added sugar, no added sodium	20 CS	6#10 CN	ambrosia	\$27.27	44975	2	ginsbergs
PINEAPPLE CRUSHED JP US GRADE B water/juice pak no added sugar, no added sodium	60 CS	6#10	san marino	\$25.60	45080	2	ginsbergs
PINEAPPLE TIDBITS JP U.S. GRADE A water/juice pak no added sugar, no added sodium	40 CS	6#10 CN	duet	\$26.15	45290	2	ginsbergs
PLUM HALVES UNPEELED JP water/juice pak no added sugar, no added sodium	6 CS	6#10	MON-D	33.59	6328231	2	US Foods
PRUNES, PITTED water/juice pak no added sugar, no added sodium	25 CS	6#10 CN	SUNSWEEP	77.88	6039234	2	US Foods
APPLE PIE FILLING U.S. GRADE B ≤ 140 mg sodium/serving, low sugar	5 CS	6#10 CN	HILLTOP HR	28.48	6331003	3	US Foods
BLUEBERRY PIE FILLING U.S. GRADE B ≤ 140 mg sodium/serving, low sugar	10 CS	6#10 CN	HILLTOP HR	\$44.93	9330994	3	US Foods
CHERRY PIE FILLING U.S. GRADE B ≤ 140 mg sodium/serving, low sugar	10 CS	6#10 CN	MONARCH	\$52.63	7330996	3	US Foods
APPLE JUICE, CLARIFIED-PLASTIC 8/60 OZ. 100% juice No added sugar, low sodium	5 CS	8/64 OZ	THIRST/MON	14.52	5340260	4	US Foods
APRICOT NECTAR-U.S. GRADE A	30 CS	12/46 OZ	Imperial	30.35	4111217	4	SYSCO
CAPRI 100% JUICE BOX	15 CS	40/6.75 OZ	Capri	14.21	7525183	4	SYSCO
CRANBERRY JUICE-PLASTIC 8/60 OZ. 100% juice No added sugar, no HF corn syrup, low sodium	50 CS	8/64 OZ	REJUV	17.85	210034	4	Maines
CRANBERRY RASPBERRY JUICE-PLASTIC 8/60 100% juice No added sugar, no HF corn syrup, low sodium	20 CS	8/64 OZ	ocean spray	\$27.38	50132	4	ginsbergs
FRUIT PUNCH-PLASTIC 8/60 OZ	30 CS	8/64 OZ	Hawaiian Punch	11.37	8141657	4	SYSCO

GRAPE JUICE, UNSWEETENED-U.S. GRADE A, 100 % juice No added sugar, low sodium	40 CS	8/64 oz	THIRST/1MON	12/46 OZ	22.70	5327408	4	US Foods
GRAPEFRUIT JUICE, UNSWEETENED U.S.GRADE A 100 % juice No added sugar, low sodium	20 CS	12/46 OZ	THIRSTER	12/46 OZ	17.56	1326677	4	US Foods
LEMON JUICE UNS-FULL STRENGTH, BOTTLE	7 CS	12/32 oz	sunfield		\$12.95	50962	4	ginsbergs
MIXED VEGETABLE JUICE U.S. GRADE A <= 360 mg sodium/serving	10 CS	12/46 OZ	v8		\$22.99	52080	4	ginsbergs
ORANGE JUICE, INDIV CUP-RTS 100 % juice No added sugar, low sodium	2 CS	96/4 OZ	ARDMORE FM	96/4 OZ	11.43	8117632	4	US Foods
ORANGE, UNSWEETENED-U.S. GRADE A, 100 % juice No added sugar, low sodium	60 CS	8/64 oz	ruby kist	12/46z	\$26.25	51415	4	ginsbergs
PINEAPPLE, UNSWEETENED U.S. GRADE A 100 % juice No added sugar, low sodium	60 CS	12/46 oz	dole		\$21.28	51550	4	ginsbergs
PRUNE, UNSWEETENED-U.S. GRADE A BOTTLES 100 % juice No added sugar, low sodium	60 CS	12/46 OZ	THIRSTER	12/46 OZ	31.63	4327409	4	US Foods
TOMATO JUICE, VEGETABLE-	20 CS	12/46 OZ	campbell	12/46 oz	17.87	4081584	4	SYSCO
TOMATO JUICE, VEGETABLE- <= 360 mg sodium/serving	20 CS	48/5.5OZ	v8 L/S		\$23.74	26880	4	ginsbergs
BANANA PUDDING-RTS-FIRST QUALITY No Trans Fat <= 360 mg sodium/serving, low sugar	30 CS	6#10 CN	MONARCH	6#10 CN	\$21.98	7327315	5	US Foods
BUTTERSCOTCH PUDDING-RTS-FIRST QUALITY No Trans Fat <= 360 mg sodium/serving, low sugar	10 CS	6#10 CN	MONARCH	6#10 CN	\$22.09	6327316	5	US Foods
CHOCOLATE PUDDING-RTS-FIRST QUALITY No Trans Fat <= 360 mg sodium/serving, low sugar	10 CS	6#10 CN	HARVEST VL	6#10 CN	\$21.34	1327337	5	US Foods
LEMON PUDDING-RTS-FIRST QUALITY No Trans Fat <= 360 mg sodium/serving, low sugar	30 CS	6#10 CN	MONARCH	6#10 CN	\$23.52	9327313	5	US Foods
RICE PUDDING-RTS-FIRT QUALITY No Trans Fat <= 360 mg sodium/serving, low sugar	30 CS	6#10 CN	MONARCH	6#10 CN	\$25.94	2327328	5	US Foods
TAPIOCA PUDDING(VAN)-RTS-FIRST QUALITY No Trans Fat <= 360 mg sodium/serving, low sugar	30 CS	6#10 CN	MONARCH	6#10 CN	\$24.91	3327319	5	US Foods
VANILLA PUDDING-RTS-FIRST QUALITY	30 CS	6#10 CN	HARVEST VL	6#10 CN	\$20.70	7327323	5	US Foods
BROTH, BEEF-ENVELOPE-DRY, LOW SODIUM <= 360 mg sodium/serving	1 CS	6/100 CT	herbox	6/50ct	\$34.60	90998	6	ginsbergs
BROTH, CHICKEN-ENVELOPE-DRY	1 CS	6/50	Herb Ox	6/50 ct	32.39	4013165	6	SYSCO
CHICKEN NOODLE SOUP IND EZ-OPEN CAMPBELLS/=	2 CS	24/7.25 OZ	CAMPBELL	24/7.25 OZ	16.34	4007951	6	US Foods
CHICKEN NOODLE SOUP-CAMPBELLS OR EQUAL <= 360 mg sodium/serving	2 CS	12/50 OZ	HEINZ	1 / 12/49.5	28.48	017640	6	Maines
CREAM OF MUSHROOM SOUP- CAMPBELLS OR =	4 CS	12/#5	Heinz	12/#5	33.66	4045217	6	SYSCO
TOMATO SOUP IND EZOPEN CAMPBELLS/=	3 CS	24/7.25 OZ	CAMPBELL	24/7.25 OZ	15.60	7007958	6	US Foods
TOMATO SOUP-CAMPBELLS OR EQUAL <= 360 mg sodium/serving	2 CS	12/51 oz	HEINZ	1 / 12/49.5	31.05	017636	6	Maines
VEGETABLE BEEF SOUP-CAMPBELLS OR EQUAL <= 360 mg sodium/serving	2 CS	12/#5 CN			\$57.35	80255	6	ginsbergs

	6 CS	12/1#	HARVEST VL	12/1 LB	\$	12.26	5328885	7	US Foods
BEEF BASE 1#-5 GAL FRANKLIN COLONY OR =	6 CS	12/1#	HARVEST VL	12/1 LB	\$	12.26	5328885	7	US Foods
BEEF BASE 1#-5 GAL FRANKLIN OR= BEEF 1ST INGRED.	15 PAILS	30 #	LEGOUT	1/30#		61.06	234284	7	Maines
CHICKEN 1#-5 GAL FRANKLIN COLONY OR =	6 CS	12/1#	major			\$19.15	76225	7	ginsbergs
CHICKEN BASE 1#-5 GAL FRANKLIN OR=CHIX 1ST INGRED.	15 PAILS	30 #	LEGOUT	1/30#		61.69	234302	7	Maines
HAM BASE-1#-5 GAL LE GOUT OR EQUAL	4 CS	12/1#	CLSC TUREE	6/1 LB	\$	19.52	4333464	7	US Foods
MUSHROOM BASE-1#-5 GAL-LE GOUT OR EQUAL	4 CS	6/16 OZ	MINOR	6/1 LB		33.85	234745	7	Maines
VEGETARIAN BASE 1#-5 GAL-LE GOUT OR =	4 CS	6/1#	CLSC TUREE	6/1 LB	\$	11.73	9333493	7	US Foods
BAKED BEANS-GRANDMA BROWNS must be <= 480 mg sodium/serving, prefer <= 360	20 CS	6#10	grandma's			\$40.17	90230	8	ginsbergs
BEANS BLACK CND US GRADE A <= 140 mg sodium/serving OR no added salt	20 CS	6/10	hanover			\$21.13	89545	8	ginsbergs
BEANS VEGETARIAN-U.S. GRADE A <= 140 mg sodium/serving	20 CS	6#10	dawnglo			\$19.85	90440	8	ginsbergs
BEANS WAX SHORT CUT 1 1/2 IN. US GRADE A, <= 140 mg sodium/serving OR no added salt	30 CS	6#10 CN	libby			\$20.40	90125	8	ginsbergs
BEANS, GREAT NORTHERN CND-US GRADE A, <= 140 mg sodium/serving OR no added salt	20 CS	6#10	hanover			\$19.61	89950	8	ginsbergs
BEANS, GREEN CUT US GRADE A	120 CS	6#10 CN	Sunny farm	6#10		18.78	8538348	8	SYSCO
BEANS, GREEN FRENCH CUT-US GRADE A	10 CS	6#10 CN	Classic	6#10		26.92	4062568	8	SYSCO
BEANS, ITALIAN CUT U.S. GRADE A	10 CS	6#10 CN	Classic	6#10		29.60	4707188	8	SYSCO
BEANS, KIDNEY RED DARK-U.S. GRADE A <= 140 mg sodium/serving OR no added salt	50 CS	6#10	hanover			\$20.94	90020	8	ginsbergs
BEANS, PINTO U.S. GRADE A	10 CS	6#10 CN	CasaSolana	6#10		21.59	3962274	8	SYSCO
BEANS, SALAD(THREE BEAN) US GRADE A <= 140 mg sodium/serving OR no added salt	20 CS	6#10	furmano			\$27.95	89465	8	ginsbergs
BEEETS DICED U.S. GRADE A <= 140 mg sodium/serving OR no added salt	25 CS	6#10 CN	hanover			\$19.45	90545	8	ginsbergs
BEEETS, SLICED-U.S. GRADE A, <= 140 mg sodium/serving OR no added salt	30 CS	6#10	unipro			\$20.05	90695	8	ginsbergs
CARROTS SLICED- US GRADE A <= 140 mg sodium/serving OR no added salt	2 CS	6#10	comsource			\$19.45	91190	8	ginsbergs
CHICKPEAS US GRADE A <= 140 mg sodium/serving OR no added salt	8 CS	6#10	hanover			\$19.16	91385	8	ginsbergs
CORN, CREAMSTYLE-US GRADE A	15 CS	6#10 CN	Reliance	6#10		23.03	0582106	8	SYSCO
CORN, WHOLE KERNAL-US GRADE A <= 140 mg sodium/serving OR no added salt	15 CS	6#10 CN	sunfield			\$24.57	91630	8	ginsbergs
MIXED VEGETABLES-NO POTATOES-US GRADE A, <= 140 mg sodium/serving OR no added salt	60 CS	6#10	hanover			\$28.84	91700	8	ginsbergs

MUSHROOM, PIECES AND STEMS-DOMESTIC ONLY ≤ 140 mg sodium/serving OR no added salt	12 CS	6#10 CN	port royal		\$39.09	91880	8	ginsbergs
PEAS, SWEET-US GRADE A ≤ 140 mg sodium/serving OR no added salt	12 CS	6#10 CN	hart		\$20.39	92495	8	ginsbergs
PIMENTOS, SLICED ≤ 140 mg sodium/serving	3 CS	24/14 oz	INTL GREEN	24/14Z	\$26.02	6333488	8	US Foods
POTATOES WHOLE WHITE X-TINY14OCT US GR A ≤ 140 mg sodium/serving OR no added salt	50 CS	6#10 CN	sunfield		\$25.33	93564	8	ginsbergs
POTATOES, WHOLE SWEET40-50CT US GRADE A want ≤ 140 mg sodium/serving, low sugar	50 CS	6#10 CN	allen		\$43.81	93450	8	ginsbergs
POTATOES-DICED, WHITE-US GRADE A	50 CS	6#10 CN	Classic	6#10	25.29	4108866	8	SYSCO
SAUERKRAUT-SHREDED-US GRADE A ≤ 140 mg sodium/serving	10 CS	6#10	silver floss		\$26.63	93765	8	ginsbergs
SPINACH WHOLE LEAF US GRADE A	10 CS	6#10	Popeyes	6#10	25.77	4949376	8	SYSCO
TOMATO PASTE US GR A-NO MORE THAN 28% S ≤ 140 mg sodium/serving	20 CS	6#10 CN	ROSELI	6#10 CN	32.73	2329431	8	US Foods
TOMATO PUREE-US GRADE A, ≤ 140 mg sodium/serving	20 CS	6#10	furmano		\$18.90	88960	8	ginsbergs
TOMATO SAUCE -US GRADE A, ≤ 360 mg sodium/serving	20 CS	6#10 CN	furmano		\$16.54	88375	8	ginsbergs
TOMATOES DICED, NO ADDED SALT- ANGELA MIA'S OR =	100 cs	6#10	angela mia		\$25.15	89001	8	ginsbergs
TOMATOES, CRUSHED BULK PACK-US GRADE A ≤ 140 mg sodium/serving	200 CS	3 GAL	ANGMIA	3/GAL	\$18.40	16380	8	REINHART
TOMATOES, CRUSHED NO SALT ADDED- ANGELA MIA OR =	100 cs	6#10	ANGELA MIA	6#10 CN	\$ 21.58	1706514	8	US Foods
TOMATOES, CRUSHED- US GRADE A ≤ 140 mg sodium per 1/2 cup serving	20 cs	6#10	furmano		\$17.44	88510	8	ginsbergs
TOMATOES, DICED IN JUICE-US GRADE A ≤ 140 mg sodium/serving	100 CS	6#10 CN	furmano		\$18.92	89005	8	ginsbergs
TOMATOES, STEWED-US GRADE A ≤ 140 mg sodium/serving	60 CS	6#10	furmano		\$20.85	89260	8	ginsbergs
OLIVES, BLACK- SLICED ≤ 140 mg sodium/serving	2 CS	6#10	INTL GREEN	6#10 CN	29.34	7333479	9	US Foods
OLIVES, GREEN, STUFFED	1 CS	4/1 GAL	Oltimo	4/1 gallon	39.36	5875941	9	SYSCO
PICKLE RELISH, SWEET- FIRST QUALITY ≤ 140 mg sodium/serving	6 CS	4/1 GAL	HARVEST VL	4/1 GA	20.05	2699270	9	US Foods
PICKLES BREAD & BUTTER ≤ 140 mg sodium/serving	10 CS	4/1 GAL	B & G	4/1 GA	24.65	3983301	9	US Foods
PICKLES, DILL SPEARS-FIRST QUALITY ≤ 140 mg sodium/serving	3 CS	4/1 GAL	plkpak		\$27.91	73120	9	ginsbergs
PICKLES, SWEET CHIPS FIRST QUALITY	3 CS	4/1 GAL	B & G	4/1 GA	24.65	3983301	9	US Foods
JELLY ASSORTED, PCS	650 CS	400/.5 OZ	AMERICANA	1 / 200 CT	6.70	008270	10	Maines
JELLY, DIET, ASSORTED,PCS	60 CS	200 CT	SMUCKER	200 / 3/8 OZ	14.06	307249	10	Maines

JELLY, GRAPE 1ST QUALITY (NO GLASS JARS)	60 CS	6#10 CN				6/4#	31.80	4184453	10	SYSCO
JELLY, SUGAR FREE ASSORTED PC'S	200/CS		ppi		reduced calorie		\$12.58	27570	10	ginsbergs
MARMALADE, ORANGE (NO GLASS JARS)	1 CS	6#10 CN	CARRIAGE HOUSE		6 / #10		55.87	303180	10	Maines
DRESSING BLUE CHEESE, PC CUPS	10 CS	200/CS	House rec		128/1.5 oz		26.81	9306051	11	SYSCO
DRESSING COLE SLAW -1ST QUALITY ≤ 290 mg sodium/serving	25 CS	4/1 GAL	KATKIT		4/1 GAL		\$32.10	12402	11	REINHART
DRESSING, FRENCH, SYSCO OR = ≤ 290 mg sodium/serving	4 CS	4/GAL	KATKIT		4/1 GAL		\$25.80	12420	11	REINHART
DRESSING, ITALIAN, DIET PC'S ≤ 290 mg sodium/serving	20 CS	200 CT	DIETSOURCE		200 / 12G		18.33	306012	11	Maines
DRESSING, ITALIAN, PC CUPS	70 CS	200 CT			200/12 gm		13.63	4949897	11	SYSCO
DRESSING, ITALIAN, SYSCO OR = ≤ 290 mg sodium/serving	4 CS	4/1 GAL	HARVEST VL		4/1 GA		16.32	2928706	11	US Foods
DRESSING, LOW FAT BALSAMIC VINAIGRETTE	2 CS	4/1 GAL	Ken's		4/1 gallon		31.25	8491102	11	SYSCO
DRESSING, LOW FAT FRENCH SYSCO OR = ≤ 290 mg sodium/serving	4 CS	4/1 GAL	KATKIT		4/1 GAL		\$24.56	17164	11	REINHART
DRESSING, LOW FAT ITALIAN, SYSCO OR = ≤ 290 mg sodium/serving	4 CS	4/1 GAL	KENS		4 / 1 GAL		21.15	301445	11	Maines
DRESSING, LOW FAT RANCH, SYSCO OR = ≤ 290 mg sodium/serving	4 CS	4/1 GAL	KENS		4 / 1 GAL		33.01	301742	11	Maines
DRESSING, RANCH, PC CUPS ≤ 290 mg sodium/serving	10 CS	200 CT	CULSEC		100/1 OZ		\$11.92	14962	11	REINHART
DRESSING, RANCH, SYSCO OR =	4 CS	4/GAL	Reliance		4/1 gallon		32.60	5740592	11	SYSCO
DRESSING, SUN DRIED TOMATO VINEG KENS/=	4 CS	4/1 GAL	Imperial		2/1 gallon		23.80	6617666	11	SYSCO
MAYONNAISE LOW FAT KEN'S OR = ≤ 290 mg sodium/serving	15 CS	4/1 GAL	MONARCH		4/1 GA		21.81	5328323	11	US Foods
MAYONNAISE, PC'S ≤ 290 mg sodium/serving	150 CS	500 CT	CULSEC		500/9g		\$23.07	14748	11	REINHART
MAYONNAISE-KEN'S OR = ≤ 290 mg sodium/serving	20 CS	4/1 gal	HARVEST VL		4/1 GA		21.08	7329113	11	US Foods
SALAD DRESSING-AMERICAN OR =, ≤ 290 mg sodium/serving	90 CS	4/1 GAL	KATKIT		4/1 GAL		\$19.02	17108	11	REINHART
BARBQUE SAUCE-1ST QUALITY ≤ 290 mg sodium/serving or reduced sodium	10 CS	4/1 GAL	MARZETTI		4/1 GAL		\$29.05	25854	12	REINHART
BBQ SAUCE PC CUP-BULL'S EYE OR = ≤ 290 mg sodium/serving or reduced sodium	4 CS	144 CT	BULLSEYE		100/1 OZ		10.06	390799	12	US Foods
CARAMEL SAUCE SQUEEZE BOTTLE	4 CS	12/19.25 OZ	Smucker's		12/20 oz		26.11	5949755	12	SYSCO
CHILI SAUCE, ≤ 290 mg sodium/serving	2 CS	6#10 CN	MON-D		6#10 CN		21.19	9328543	12	US Foods
CHOCOLATE SYRUP -HERSHEY'S OR =	4 CS	4/1 GAL	MONARCH		4/1 GA		\$ 26.86	8351546	12	US Foods

CORN SYRUP -LIGHT	1 CS	4/1 GAL	MONARCH	4/1 GA	\$ 26.78	1373935	12	US Foods
DIJON MUSTARD	1 CS	6/32 OZ	GRY POUAPON	6/24 OZ	\$ 30.41	7003973	12	US Foods
GRAVY BROWN READT TO SERVE LE GOUT OR =	5 CS	12/50 OZ	Classic	12/50 oz	29.85	4189023	12	SYSCO
GRAVY COUNTRY SAUSAGE RTS-CHEFMATE OR =, <= 360 mg sodium/serving	10 CS	6/#10	HOME TASTE	6/#10 CN	43.68	3351475	12	US Foods
GRAVY POULTRY READY TO SERVE-LEGOUT OR=, <= 360 mg sodium/serving	5 CS	12/50 OZ	HOME TASTE	12/49 OZ	27.08	082594	12	US Foods
GRAVY SEASONING-KITCHEN BOUQUET OR =, <= 360 mg sodium/serving	75 QT	12/32 OZ	kitchen bouquet		\$82.13	76895	12	ginsbergs
HONEY, PC'S	5 CS	500/CS	CHEF MARK	500 / 9 GM	32.72	306121	12	Maines
HONEY, PURE WHITE	1 CS	6/5#	KATYS KITCHEN	6 / 5 LB	83.85	306362	12	Maines
HORSERADISH PC'S	5 CS	200 CT	MONARCH	200/12 GR	\$ 9.30	5329719	12	US Foods
KETCHUP -BULK PACK-US GRADE A, reduced sodium	50 CS	3 GAL	heinz		\$16.30	87520	12	ginsbergs
KETCHUP -US GRADE A, reduced sodium	20 CS	6/#10 CN	port royal		\$18.92	87525	12	ginsbergs
KETCHUP, PC'S, reduced sodium	120 CS	500 CT	plknik		\$5.20	87754	12	ginsbergs
LEMON JUICE, PC'S	1 CS	500/CS	CHEF MARK	500 / 4 GM	10.62	306126	12	Maines
MAPLE SYRUP BOTTLES	3 CS	24/24 OZ	CARYS	12 / 12 OZ	20.00	304795	12	Maines
MAPLE SYRUP, IMITATION, PC CUPS	40 CS	100 CT	MONARCH	100/1 OZ	\$ 6.14	5329644	12	US Foods
MAPLE SYRUP, SUGAR FREE PC'S	5 CS	200 CT	MONARCH	100/1 OZ	\$ 7.56	5596937	12	US Foods
MOLASSES, DARK-US GRADE B	1 CS	4/1 GAL	HORN OF PLENTY	4 / 1 GAL	37.63	3895665	12	Maines
MUSTARD, PC'S	80 CS	500 CT	AMERICANA	1 / 500 CT	4.79	008282	12	Maines
MUSTARD, PREPARED- 1ST QUALITY	4 CS	4/1 gal	admiration		\$11.42	32175	12	ginsbergs
NON-DAIRY CREAMER-POWDER-FLAT PK, NO CUP	30 CS	1000	MONARCH	2000 EA	\$ 20.42	7436454	12	US Foods
PAN COATING-WESSON OR EQUAL	20 CS	6/17 OZ	HARVEST VL	6/16.5 OZ	\$ 7.99	8928700	12	US Foods
PEANUT BUTTER, CREAMY-TEDDIE OR= 1STQ, <= 290 mg sodium/serving	120 CS	6/5#	Hampton farms	6/5 LB	\$ 36.09	6756811	12	US Foods
PICKLE RELISH, SWEET, PC'S <= 290 mg sodium/serving	10 CS	500 CT	MONARCH	200/9 GR	7.07	6329213	12	US Foods
RAISINS, SEEDLESS-1ST QUALITY	8 CS	24/15 OZ	PACKER	24/15 OZ	\$ 36.66	8054454	12	US Foods

RASPBERRY SAUCE SQUEEZE BTL	2 CS	12/15 OZ	LYONS MAGNUS	12 / 15 OZ	23.73	304798	12	Maines
SALAD OIL, VEGETABLE 1ST QUALITY Trans fat Free	40 CS	6/1 GAL	ROSELI	6/1 GAL	\$ 25.37	6781751	12	US Foods
SAUCE TERIYAKI ≤ 290 mg sodium/serving OR reduced sodium	2 CS	4/1 GAL	LACHOY	4/1 GAL	\$40.44	20498	12	REINHART
SOY SAUCE ≤ 290 mg sodium/serving OR reduced sodium	1 CS	4/4 GAL	Lachoy	1 gal	\$12.11	2050326	12	US Foods
SPAGHETTI SAUCE RTS HANOVER OR EQUAL must be ≤ 480 mg sodium/serving, prefer ≤ 360 mg	20 CS	6#10 CN	MON-D	6#10 CN	18.10	7328503	12	US Foods
TABASCO SAUCE	1 CS	24/6 OZ	MCILHENNY	12 / 12 OZ	65.86	304950	12	Maines
TACO SAUCE-PC'S MILD-PPI OR =	50 CS	500/CS	AMERICANA	1 / 500 CT	10.78	008290	12	Maines
TARTAR SAUCE, PC'S	100 CS	500 CT	AMERICANA	1 / 200 CT	6.08	008286	12	Maines
VINEGAR, CIDER-5% ACETIC	10 CS	4/1 gal	admiration		\$8.34	33670	12	ginsbergs
VINEGAR, TABLE PC'S	4 CS	200 CT	HEINZ	200 / 9 GR	8.72	306887	12	Maines
VINEGAR, WHITE-5% ACETIC	2 CS	4/1 GAL	OASIS	4 / 1 GAL	6.10	305866	12	Maines
WORCHESTERSHIRE SAUCE-1ST QUALITY	3 CS	4/1 GAL	Classic	4/1 gallon	25.40	4007894	12	SYSCO
BASIL LEAVES-FRENCH OR EQUAL	6 EA	28 OZ	MONARCH	26 OZ	\$ 10.75	897868	13	US Foods
BAY LEAVES-FRENCH OR EQUAL	1 EA	12 OZ	MONARCH	12 OZ	\$ 7.35	760793	13	US Foods
CELERY SALT, ≤ 290 mg sodium/serving	4 EA	32 OZ	CULSEC	32 OZ	\$6.22	24156	13	REINHART
CELERY SEED No sodium or reduced sodium	4 EA	32 OZ	CULSEC	16 OZ	\$7.36	24204	13	REINHART
CHILL POWDER	6 EA	16 OZ	MONARCH	18 OZ	\$ 3.64	760116	13	US Foods
CHIVES-FRENCH OR EQUAL	6 EA	1oz	MONARCH	1 OZ	\$ 2.44	760140	13	US Foods
CINNAMON, GROUND FRENCH OR =	6 EA	16 OZ	MONARCH	18 OZ	\$ 3.81	5353115	13	US Foods
CLOVES, GROUND-FRENCH OR =	1 EA	16 OZ	MONARCH	16 OZ	\$ 8.21	760678	13	US Foods
CREAM OF TARTAR FRENCH OR =	1 EA	32 OZ	MONARCH	32 OZ	\$ 8.24	760207	13	US Foods
CUMIN, GROUND-FRENCH OR =	1 EA	15 OZ	MONARCH	16 OZ	\$ 4.51	760629	13	US Foods
CURRY POWDER-FRENCH OR EQUAL	1 EA	17 OZ	MONARCH	16 OZ	\$ 4.45	760223	13	US Foods
DILL WEED	3 EA	5 OZ	MONARCH	5.5 OZ	\$ 4.74	778423	13	US Foods
GARLIC POWDER-MC CORMICK OR EQUAL	12 EA	19 OZ	spice co	12/16z	\$35.72	83730	13	ginsbergs
GINGER, GROUND-FRENCH OR EQUAL	1 EA	16 OZ	MONARCH	15 OZ	\$ 5.85	760306	13	US Foods

LEMON PEPPER SEASONING <= 290 mg sodium/serving	3 EA	16 OZ	CULSEC	28 OZ	\$10.26	28588	13	REINHART
MUSTARD, DRY-FRENCH OR EQUAL	1 EA	16 OZ	MONARCH	15 OZ	\$ 2.60	760348	13	US Foods
NUTMEG, GROUND-FRENCH OR EQUAL	1 EA	16 OZ	MONARCH	16 OZ	\$ 6.20	760355	13	US Foods
ONION POWDER-MC CORMICK OR EQUAL	12 EA	20 OZ	MONARCH	20 OZ	\$ 2.78	4353280	13	US Foods
OREGANO LEAVES, WHOLE- FRENCH OR EQUAL	1 EA	24 OZ	spice co	6/24z	\$29.34	84510	13	ginsbergs
PAPRIKA-FRENCH OR EQUAL	6 EA	16 OZ	spice co	12/16z	\$39.99	84580	13	ginsbergs
PARSLEY FLAKES -FRENCH OR EQUAL	10 EA	10 OZ	MONARCH	11 OZ	\$ 5.35	760868	13	US Foods
PEPER, BLACK TALBE GRIND-MC CORMICK OR =	15 EA	16 OZ	NYSID	4/4.4#	77.97	7313398	13	SYSCO
PEPPER, BLACK PC'S	18 CS	6/1000	handy	3/1000ct	\$9.23	86595	13	ginsbergs
PEPPER, CAYENNE-FRENCH OR EQUAL	1 EA	16 OZ	MONARCH	16 OZ	\$ 3.61	760611	13	US Foods
PEPPER, WHITE-MC CORMICK OR EQUAL	5 EA	16 OZ	MONARCH	18 OZ	\$ 9.33	6353403	13	US Foods
PICKLING SPICE-MC CORMICK OR EQUAL	3 EA	12 OZ	MONARCH	14 OZ	\$ 3.59	760645	13	US Foods
POULTRY SEASONING-FRENCH OR EQUAL	1 EA	10 OZ	CULSEC	10 OZ	\$8.32	24132	13	REINHART
ROSEMARY, LEAVES-FRENCH OR EQUAL	2 EA	6 OZ	MONARCH	6 OZ	\$ 3.56	760652	13	US Foods
ROTISSERIE CHICKEN SEASONING, MC CORMICK No sodium or reduced sodium	2 EA	20 OZ	CULSEC	6/25 OZ	\$64.82	R3212	13	REINHART
SALT FREE SEASONING PC PKT MRS DASH	4 CS	300 CT	MRSDSH	500/CNT	\$32.59	55918	13	REINHART
SALT IODIZED BOXED lowest sodium choice	10 CS	24/26 OZ	handgrd	430mg per 1/4 tsp	\$10.46	86747	13	ginsbergs
SALT, IODIZED PC'S lowest sodium choice	15CS	6/1000 ct	handgrd	1/8 tsp 3000ct	\$4.26	86840	13	ginsbergs
SMOKED LIQUID FLAVORING	1 CS	QT	WRIGHTS	4/1 GA	\$ 35.18	5003975	13	US Foods
THYME, LEAVES-FRENCH OR EQUAL	1 EA	6 OZ	MONARCH	7 OZ	\$ 3.80	760694	13	US Foods
TUMERIC-FRENCH OR EQUAL	1 EA	15 OZ	MONARCH	16 OZ	\$ 4.08	760769	13	US Foods
COFFEE, DECAFFEINATED, INSTANT PC'S	8 CS	500 CT	Sanka	1000 ct	78.43	5125869	14	SYSCO
COFFEE, GROUND ROAST, HOTEL GRIND	30 CS	21/16z	D. eggbert	24/12z	\$87.98	6237325	14	US Foods
COFFEE, GROUND-DECAFFEINATED	10 CS	16/12 OZ	Stnbrsp	18/12 oz	63.69	6958201	14	SYSCO
NONFAT DRY MILK POWDER BULK-REDI OR =	12 BAGS	55# BAG	Classic	25#	54.53	5398946	14	SYSCO

TEA BAGS DECAF IND. WRAP W/TAG	5 CS	5/100 CT	RITUALS	5/100 EA	\$ 15.94	183103	14	US Foods
TEA, ORANGE PEKOE IND. WRAP W/TAG	15 CS	10/100ct	DAIRY BARN	10/100 EA	\$ 18.75	9157694	14	US Foods
BISCUIT MIX-PILLSBURY OR EQUAL	30 CS	6/5 LB	hospitality		\$23.35	7260	15	ginsbergs
BISQUICK MIX	2 CS	6/5#	Bisquick	6/5 LB	\$37.11	6002315	15	US Foods
BROWNIE MIX - PILLSBURY OR EQUAL	25 CS	6/6# BOX	CONTINENTL	6/5 LB	\$ 27.05	7316490	15	US Foods
CAKE MIX CHOCOLATE-PILLSBURY OR EQUAL	20 CS	6/5 #	CONTINENTL MILL	6 / 5 LB	27.97	380003	15	Maines
CAKE MIX, CARROT WITH FRST-PILLSBURY	6 CS	4/5#	GOLD MEDAL	6 / 5 LB	66.87	384607	15	Maines
CAKE MIX, SPICE-PILLSBURY OR EQUAL	20 CS	6/5# BOX	GOLD MEDAL	6/5 LB	\$ 48.47	2000180	15	US Foods
CAKE MIX, WHITE-PILLSBURY OR EQUAL	30 CS	6/5 #BOX	Reliance	6/5#	23.14	5301601	15	SYSCO
CAKE MIX, YELLOW - PILLSBURY OR EQUAL	30 CS	6/5#	Reliance	6/5#	23.14	5301627	15	SYSCO
CHEESECAKE MIX-ROYAL OR EQUAL	2 CS	6/4# BOX	MONARCH	6/4 LB	\$ 67.49	1371756	15	US Foods
CIN. STRU. COFFEE CAKE MIX W/TOPPING PIL	10 CS	4/5# BOX	hospitality	has trans fat	\$26.99	7950	15	ginsbergs
GINGERBREAD MIX - PILLSBURY OR EQUAL	25 CS	6/5# BOX	Hospitality	6/5#	24.25	8946451	15	SYSCO
MUFFIN MIX, APPLESAUCE CINNAMON-PILLSBUR	3 CS	6/5 LB	GOLD MEDAL	6 / 5 LB	65.57	382500	15	Maines
MUFFIN MIX, BASIC-PILLSBURY OR EQUAL	10 CS	6/5# BOX	CONTINENTL MILL	6 / 5 LB	22.58	380007	15	Maines
MUFFIN MIX, BLUEBERRY-PILLSBURY OR =	3 CS	6/5 #	CONTINENTL	6/5 LB	\$ 23.94	4386884	15	US Foods
MUFFIN MIX, BRAN-PILLSBURY OR EQUAL	3 CS	6/5# BOX	GOLD MEDAL	6/5 LB	\$ 46.17	7002314	15	US Foods
MUFFIN MIX, CORN-PILLSBURY OR =	15 CS	6/5# BOX	CONTINENTL MILL	6 / 5 LB	23.01	380005	15	Maines
MUFFIN MIX, ORANGE CRANBERRY-PILLS OR =	3 CS	6/5#	GOLD MEDAL	6/5 LB	\$ 63.17	9013434	15	US Foods
MUFFIN MIX-LOW FAT-VARIETY-GEN MILLS	10 CS	6/5#	GOLD MEDAL	6/4.5 LB	\$ 46.17	9085483	15	US Foods
PANCAKE MIX COMPLETE	2 CS	6/5#	CONTINENTL	6/5 LB	\$ 18.55	8360257	15	US Foods
ALMOND EXTRACT	2 PT	PINT	MONARCH	1 QT	\$ 4.41	761452	16	US Foods
BAKING POWDER, DOUBLE ACTING	1 CS	5#	comsource	6/5#	\$28.10	86145	16	ginsbergs
BAKING SODA	2 CS	24/1#	HOSPITALTY	12/2 LB	\$ 14.42	1043975	16	US Foods
CHOCOLATE CHIPS - SUGAR MILL OR EQUAL	2 CS	25 LB	sugar mill	has trans fat.	\$37.62	86230	16	ginsbergs

CHERRIOS-KELLOGGS OR EQUAL	10 CS	96 CT	general mills			9536	18	ginsbergs
CORN FLAKES BULK-HOSPITALITY OR EQUAL	50 CS	20#	GILSTR	20/LBS		\$19.15	18	REINHART
CORN FLAKES-KELLOGGS OR EQUAL	50 CS	96 CT	mom			\$21.54	18	ginsbergs
CORNFLAKES BOWL PAK -KELLOGGS OR EQUAL	10 CS	96/75	mom			\$21.54	18	ginsbergs
CREAM OF RICE-NBC OR EQUAL	60 CS	12/28 OZ	House Recipe	12/28 oz		37.36	18	SYSCO
CREAM OF WHEAT INSTANT PC-NBC OR EQUAL	8 CS	96 CT	CRM WHEAT	12/12/1 OZ	\$	47.52	18	US Foods
CREAM OF WHEAT-NBC OR EQUAL	46 BAGS	50#	mom	12/28Z		\$21.87	18	ginsbergs
OATMEAL, INSTANT PC-QUAKER OR EQUAL	8 CS	48 CT	mom			\$8.97	18	ginsbergs
OATMEAL, QUICK COOKING-QUAKER OR EQUAL	70 BAGS	50#	STURM & SN	50 LB	\$	24.25	18	US Foods
RAISIN BRAN-KELLOGGS OR EQUAL	20 CS	96 CT	mom			\$19.96	18	ginsbergs
RICE KRISPIES-KELLOGGS OR EQUAL	30 CS	96 CT	mom			\$20.38	18	ginsbergs
SHREDDED WHEAT-KELLOGGS OR EQUAL	15 CS	96 CT	KELLOGG'S	70/1.2 OZ	\$	25.02	18	US Foods
SINGLE SERVE POUCH CEREALS-SWEETENED	100 CS	96 CT	GENL MILLS	96/95 OZ	\$	24.12	18	US Foods
SPECIAL K- KELLOGGS OR EQUAL	15 CS	96 CT	kellogg			\$21.30	18	ginsbergs
TOASTED OATS	20 CS	20#	GILSTR	20/LBS		\$25.67	18	REINHART
TOTAL - KELLOGGS OR EQUAL	10 CS	96 CT	GENL MILLS	70/75 OZ	\$	28.77	18	US Foods
WHEATIES - KELLOGGS OR EQUAL	20 CS	96 CT	GENL MILLS	70/75 OZ	\$	28.62	18	US Foods
COOKIE ASST FLAVORS 4 PK	5 CS	216/4PK	Good Source	312 / 4 pack	\$0.105 ea = \$32.76 CS	Veries	19	Good Source
COOKIE PREBAKED, SOFT & CHEWY SUGAR FREE INDIVIDUAL	20 CS	212 CT	DARLIN	212/CNT		\$50.10	19	REINHART
COOKIE PREBAKED, SOFT & CHEWY, SUGAR 1OZ INDIVIDUAL	20 CS	216 CT	DARLIN	216/CNT		\$32.12	19	REINHART
COOKIE PREBAKED,SOFT & CHEWY CHOC CH 1OZ INDIVIDUAL	20 CS	216 CT	DARLIN	216/CNT		\$32.12	19	REINHART
CRACKER CRUMBS GRAHM NO ADDED SUGAR	2 CS	10# BAG	KEEBLER	10 LB	\$	18.87	19	US Foods
CRACKER MEAL MEDIUM	4 CS	6/5#	G&L	25 LB	\$	17.91	19	US Foods
CRACKERS GRAHAM BULK-NABISCO OR =	5 CS	8.1#	Nabisco	8.1#		22.14	19	SYSCO
CRACKERS GRAHAM BULK-NABISCO OR =	5 CS	8.1#	KEEBLER	10 LB	\$	25.21	19	US Foods

CRACKERS, ANIMAL INDIV PKG-KEEBLER OR=	20 CS	200/1 OZ	AUSTIN	100/1 OZ	\$ 12.50	6305130	19	US Foods
CRACKERS, ASST BULK	3 CS	6.25#	NABISCO	24 EA	\$ 30.46	5054814	19	US Foods
CRACKERS, CINNAMON CRISP GRAHAM PC'S WRP	15 CS	300 CT	Pepperidge	300 ct	45.82	0152884	19	SYSCO
CRACKERS, GRAHAM PC'S WRAPPED-BURRY OR=	80 CS	200/2 CT	keebler		\$15.28	19672	19	ginsbergs
CRACKERS, HONEY GRAHAM PC'S WRPD KEBLR =	15 CS	200/2 CT	KEEBLER	200/2 EA	\$ 12.19	7036361	19	US Foods
CRACKERS, SALTINES PC'S WRP SUNSHINE OR=	35 CS	500/2 CT	SUNSHINE	500/2 EA	\$ 9.33	4015665	19	US Foods
CRACKERS, SALTINES, LOW SODIUM, PC'S WRP	12 CS	500/2 CT	NABISCO PR	500/2 EA	\$ 14.46	9007543	19	US Foods
CRACKERS/PEANUT BUTTER	8 CS	120/4 CT	AUSTIN	24/6/4 EA	\$15.25	7801483	19	US Foods
CROUTONS, PLAIN	2 CS	4/2.5#	MONARCH	5/2 LB	\$ 14.60	5610456	19	US Foods
CRUMBS, PLAIN BREAD	3 CS	6/5#	classic		\$15.80	6966	19	ginsbergs
GOLDFISH BAKED SNACK CRACKERS	2 CS	150/1 OZ	PEPPERIDGE	60/1 OZ	\$13.07	2005155	19	US Foods
NUTRI-GRAIN BAR-BLUEBERRY CHILD NUTRITION	5 CS	96/1.55 oz	KELLOG	48/1.3oz	\$21.46	11510	19	REINHART
PC FIG NEWTONS 2 COOKIES/PKG	10 CS	120/2 OZ	Field stone	192/1.5	42.78	7599826	19	SYSCO
POTATO CHIPS, INDIVIDUAL SERV	40 CS	60/1 oz	Jean's	60 ct	13.49	5344536	19	SYSCO
POTATO CHIPS-JEANS OR =	170 CS	8/1#	Jean's	8/1#	14.69	5277454	19	SYSCO
RTS COOKIES CHOC CHIP 24 PKG/CS	60 CS	10 #	nbc	20ct has trans f	\$18.79	20910	19	ginsbergs
RTS COOKIES FIG NEWTONS	10 CS	24/8 CT	nbc	12/7z	\$18.70	22046	19	ginsbergs
RTS COOKIES FIG NEWTONS	10 CS	24/8 CT	Fieldstone	192/1.5 oz	42.78	7599826	19	SYSCO
RTS COOKIES VANILLA WAFERS	8 CS	8/13.3OZ	MONARCH	12/13.3 OZ	\$ 16.21	4369997	19	US Foods
SCOOBY GRAHAM CRACKER STICKS	2 CS	150/1 OZ	kellogg	210/1z	\$37.56	19720	19	ginsbergs
SNACK COOKIE JUNGLE BKD WHOLE GRAIN	5 CS	200/1 OZ	REDIBK	200/9oz	\$42.76	77548	19	REINHART
SNACK MIX-KIDS MIX QUAKER OR =	2 CS	150/7/8 OZ	frito lay	104/88ct	\$28.05	61593	19	ginsbergs
TOAST MELBA BULK KEEBLER OR =	10 CS	300/2	OLD LONDON	320 / 2 CT	37.81	320471	19	Maines
TORTILLA CHIPS-ROGER OR =	10 CS	5/1#	SNYDER	6/1 LB	\$8.00	B6598	19	REINHART
BACON BITS	1 CS	20#	KATKIT	10/LBS	\$13.86	E5800	20	REINHART

COCOA MIX PC-1ST QUALITY	15 CS	6/50	swiss miss		\$37.32	18340	20	ginsbergs
COCOA MIX SUG FREE PC'S	10 CS	6/25 CT	strum		\$22.91	18360	20	ginsbergs
FOOD THICKENER THICK & EASY OR = BULK	10 CS	25 POUND	hhl		\$54.70	27467	20	ginsbergs
FOOD THICKENER-PC-HONEY CONSIST TH&EASY=	480 CS	100/CS	hhl		\$11.92	27469	20	ginsbergs
FOOD THICKENER-PC-NECTAR CONSIST TH&EASY	650 CS	100/CS	hhl		\$11.62	27468	20	ginsbergs
GELATIN ASSORTED, CITRUS, DIET	9 CS	18/2.75	Bernard	18/2.75 oz	\$32.40	506 series	20	Bernard
GELATIN ASSORTED, REDS, DIET -GAGE OR =	4 CS	18/2.75	Bernard	18/2.75 oz	\$32.40	506 series	20	Bernard
GELATIN, BLUEBERRY -ROYAL OR =	2 CS	12/24 OZ	Classic	12/24 oz	28.13	5772462	20	SYSCO
GELATIN, CHERRY -ROYAL OR =	8 CS	12/24 OZ	MONARCH	12/24 OZ	\$ 21.11	83709322	20	US Foods
GELATIN, LEMON-ROYAL OR =	10 CS	12/24 OZ	MONARCH	12/24 OZ	\$ 21.43	2370666	20	US Foods
GELATIN, LIME-ROYAL OR =	4 CS	12/24 OZ	MONARCH	12/24 OZ	\$ 21.43	6370662	20	US Foods
GELATIN, ORANGE-ROYAL OR =	10 CS	12/24 OZ	MONARCH	12/24 OZ	\$ 21.43	1328848	20	US Foods
GELATIN, RASPBERRY -ROYAL OR=	10 CS	12/24 OZ	MONARCH	12/24 OZ	\$ 21.11	8370660	20	US Foods
GELATIN, STRAWBERRY-ROYAL OR =	10 CS	12/24 OZ	MONARCH	12/24 OZ	\$ 21.11	9370669	20	US Foods
GELATIN, STRAWBRY SHELF STBLE RTS HUNT =	2 CS	48/3.5	Handl Snack	48/3.5 oz	16.13	2081982	20	SYSCO
IND DRINK MIX, ASST FLAVOR, BERNARD OR =	50 CS	900 EACH	Good Source	2000 ct	\$0.019 ea = \$38 CS	Varies	20	Good Source
INSTANT BKFST VANILLA CARNATION	8 CS	6/10 CT	CARNATION	60/35.73 GR	\$ 25.59	6221105	20	US Foods
MILK REPLACEMENT DRINK MIX must contain same vit as milk	50 CS	1000/.25 OZ	NFG	1000 ct	\$22.00		20	National Food
PUDDING DIET PUMPKIN BID	2 CS	12/16 OZ	Bernard	12/16 oz	\$84.00	523523	20	Bernard
PUDDING, CHOCOLATE-SHELF STBL-RTS HUNT=	25 CS	48/4 oz	hunts	48/3.5z	\$14.85	47797	20	ginsbergs
PUDDING, DIET CHOC-BERNARD OR=	15 CS	12/16 OZ	Bernard	12/16 oz	\$84.00	520063	20	Bernard
PUDDING, DIET VANILLA-BERNARD OR =	15 CS	12/16 OZ	Bernard	12/16 oz	\$84.00	520143	20	Bernard
PUDDING, INSTANT CHOCOLATE	5 CS		hospitality	12/24z	\$26.92	46770	20	ginsbergs
PUDDING, INSTANT VANILLA	5 CS		hospitality	12/24z	\$24.20	46775	20	ginsbergs
PUDDING, VANILLA-SHELF STABLE-RTS HUNT=	25 CS	48/4 oz	hunts	48/3.5z	\$14.85	47802	20	ginsbergs

PUDDING,DIET-BUTTERSCH-BERNARD OR =	15 CS	12/16 OZ	Bernard	12/16 oz	\$94.00	520043	20	Bernard
WHIP AND CHILL CHOCOLATE JELLO OR =	2 CS	6/4#3OZ	Bernard	6/4# 3 oz	\$91.20	516027	20	Bernard
WHIP AND CHILL STRAWBERRY-JELLO OR=	2 CS	6/4#3OZ	Bernard	6/4# 3 oz	\$91.20	516087	20	Bernard
BARLEY,PEARL DRY	3 CS	24/1#	C&F FOODS	24/1 LB	\$ 14.61	5212675	21	US Foods
CORNBREAD STUFFING MIX -UNCLE BENS OR =	50 CS	6/3.5 LB	KATY'S KITCHEN	1 / 6/56 OZ	42.53	018044	21	Maines
FETTUCCHINI-EGG NOODLES 100% DURUM WH SEM	2 CS	10#	ROSELI	2/10#	\$ 13.76	4927870	21	US Foods
MACARONI, ELBOW 100% DURUM WH SEMOL, MED	80 CS	20 LB	premium		\$11.40	61961	21	ginsbergs
MACARONI, ELBOW HI FIBER DREAM FIELDS OR =	30 CS	10#	Dream field	10#	spec order	spec order	21	SYSCO
NOODLES DITALINI -PRINCE OR =	10 CS	20#	ROSELI	2/10 LB	\$ 13.77	7328016	21	US Foods
NOODLES EGG EXTRA WIDE PRINCE/= 100% DWS	50 CS	10# BOX	ROSELI	2/5 LB	\$ 10.14	6928678	21	US Foods
NOODLES, LASAGNA CURLY 1005 DUR WH SEM	25 CS	10 LB	ROSELI	10 LB	\$ 9.00	2328656	21	US Foods
ONIONS, DRY CHOPPED-US #1	2 CS	6/3#	GILROY	1 / 15 LB	34.29	345500	21	Maines
PEAS, GREEN SPLIT DRY-JACK RABBIT OR =	10 CS	24/1#	C&F FOODS	24/1 LB	\$ 18.56	7212673	21	US Foods
POTATO PEARLS IDAHOAN OR =	47 BAGS	50#	EXTRA RICH	6/3.7#	51.64	5308721	21	SYSCO
POTATOES DEHYDRATED SLICED 1ST QUALITY	30 BAGS	33 #	Good Source	25 lb. bag	\$41.19		21	Good Source
POTATOES, COMPLETE INST W/VIT C TRIO/=	30 BAGS	50#	*true	6#10	\$37.65	93275	21	ginsbergs
POTATOES, DEHYDRATED HASH BROWN 1ST QUAL	15 CS	6/2.5#	BHRVST	6/2.25lb	\$29.91	31868	21	REINHART
RICE, BROWN 1ST QUALITY QUICK COOK	10 CS	25#	par ex		\$12.81	94940	21	ginsbergs
RICE, BROWN 1ST QUALITY QUICK COOK	10 CS	25#	UNCBEN	25/LBS	\$27.69	25368	21	REINHART
RICE, PAR-BOILED 1ST QUALITY	50 CS	25#	DLTSTR	25/LBS	\$13.40	25404	21	REINHART
RIGATONI, 100% DUR WH SEM PRINCE OR =	9 CS	20 lb	VILFRZ	2/10 LB	\$18.05	25038	21	REINHART
SHELLS-MACARONI, MEDIUM 100% DWS PRINCE/=	6 CS	20# BOX	HARVEST VL	2/10 LB	\$ 12.51	997288	21	US Foods
SHELLS-MACARONI, SMALL 100% DWS PRINCE/=	6 CS	20# BOX	ROSELI	2/10 LB	\$ 13.77	8328023	21	US Foods
SPAGHETTI, HI FIBER DREAM FIELDS OR =	30 CS	10#	Dream field	10#	spec order	spec order	21	SYSCO
SPAGHETTI, REGULAR CUT 100% DWS PRINCE/=	75 CS	20 lb	premium		\$11.50	61962	21	ginsbergs

SPAGHETTI, REGULAR CUT GLUTEN FREE	3 CS	10#	MONARCH	12/1#	\$12.62	7633365	21	US Foods
SPIRALS, 100% DUR WH SEMOLINA PRINCE/=	40 CS	20 lb	HARVEST VL	2/10 LB	\$ 13.76	997627	21	US Foods
ZITI, CUT 100% DU WH SEMOLINA PRINCE/=	12 CS	20 LB	ROSELI	2/10 LB	\$ 7.53	3327681	21	US Foods
APPLE JUICE, UNSWEET PC SUN CUP /=	600 CS	72/4 OZ	suncup		\$7.99	49676	22	ginsbergs
APRICOT NECTAR, UNSWEET PC'S SUN CUP/=	50 CS	72/4 OZ	suncup		\$10.31	49806	22	ginsbergs
BLUEBERRIES, IQF SYSCO OR =	5 CS	30#	HONOR	30/LBS	\$43.67	B1336	22	REINHART
CRANBERRY JUICE PC'S SUN CUP OR =	700 CS	72/4 oz	suncup		\$7.56	49991	22	ginsbergs
GRAPE JUICE, UNSWEET PC'S SUN CUP/=	280 CS	72/4 OZ	suncup		\$9.88	50366	22	ginsbergs
LEMONADE CONCENTRT 7/1 FRZN MIN MAID/=	6 CS	24/12 OZ	MINMAD	12/16 OZ	\$18.91	T2024	22	REINHART
LEMONADE PC'S SUN CUP OR =	30 CS	72/4 OZ	Ardmore	96/4 oz	9.72	1992304	22	SYSCO
ORANGE JUICE UNSWEET CONCENT3/1 1ST QUAL	6 CS	12/32OZ	Gregory	12/32 oz	32.89	5437207	22	SYSCO
ORANGE JUICE, UNSWTND PC'S SUN CUP/=	1000 CS	72/4 OZ	suncup		\$9.40	51286	22	ginsbergs
PINEAPPLE JUICE, UNSWEET PC'S SUN CUP/=	650 CS	72/4 OZ	Ardmore	96/4 oz	11.33	5417571	22	SYSCO
PRUNE JUICE UNSWEET PC'S SUN CUP/=	150 CS	72/4 OZ	suncup		\$17.05	51736	22	ginsbergs
PRUNE JUICE UNSWEET PC'S SUN CUP/=	150 CS	72/4 OZ	SUNCUP	72/4 OZ	\$17.49	64088	22	REINHART
STRAWBERRIES, SLICED	60 CS	6/6.5#	MONARCH	6/6.5 LB	\$ 52.35	9327610	22	US Foods
TOMATO JUICE PC'S SUN CUP OR =	80 CS	72/4 OZ	suncup		\$7.88	51993	22	ginsbergs
APPLE PIE, THAW & SRV-NOT LATTICE 1ST QU	40 CS	6 PIES	Saralee	6/10"	\$19.14		23	National Food
BAGEL PLAIN, LENDERS OR =	10 CS	72 CT	a speciality	75/2.3z	\$13.20	125	23	ginsbergs
BANANA CREAM PIE-THAW & SRVE 1ST QUALITY	20 CS	6 PIES	Saralee	6/10"	\$19.14		23	National Food
BISCUIT BUTTERMILK 2"1 OZ BRDGEFRD OR=	5 CS	120/CS	BRIDGFORD	120 / 1 OZ	15.26	171185	23	Maines
CHEESECAKE FRZ PLAIN PHILA CREAM OR =	10 CS	4 ct	PHILDPLHIA	4/60 OZ	\$ 60.14	6220560	23	US Foods
CHOCOLATE CREAM PIE THAW& SRVE 1ST QUAL	20 CS	6/27 OZ	Saralee	6/10"	\$19.14		23	National Food
COCONUT CREAM PIE THAW & SERVE 1ST QUAL	20 CS	6/27 OZ	Saralee	6/10"	\$19.14		23	National Food
DANISH, ASST INDIV WRAPPED1ST QUAL	75 CS	24/3.25 OZ	SARA LEE	24/3.25 OZ	\$ 14.52	3017753	23	US Foods

ECLAIRS- FILLED	10 CS	48/2 OZ	RICH'S	4/12/2 OZ	\$ 29.69	8002149	23	US Foods
ENGLISH MUFFINS	15 CS	144 CT	steck		\$16.24	3485	23	ginsbergs
FRENCH TOAST AUNT JEMIMA OR =	20 CS	144 CT	mrsbutterworth		\$21.78	2800	23	ginsbergs
FRENCH TOAST STIX	15 CS	10#	Trident	16#	\$20.00	49952	23	National Food
KEY LIME PIE BISTRO COLLECTION INDIV. SARALEE=	10 CS	24/2.8 OZ	BISTRO CLC	24/2.8 OZ	\$ 25.88	5923453	23	US Foods
LEMON MERINGUE PIE, THAW& SERVE 1ST QUA	20 CS	6 CT	Saralee	6/10"	\$19.14		23	National Food
MINI CREAM PUFF - FILLED	15 CS	48/1.3 oz	RICH'S	48/1.33 OZ	\$ 27.07	9002148	23	US Foods
PANCAKES -AUNT JEMIMA OR =	40 CS	144/CS	ECHO	144/CNT	\$9.09	B2468	23	REINHART
PANCAKES MINI MAPLE BURST/STRAWBERRY PILLS=	10 CS	72 CT	Pillsbury	72/3.53z	\$27.67	3490/3491	23	ginsbergs
PIZZA, SQUARE- CHEESE GIRADI OR =	20 CS	96/EA	tonys	96/4.5z	\$42.09	34840	23	ginsbergs
PUMPKIN PIE THAW&SERVE 10 " 1ST QUAL	20 CS	6/40 OZ	Saralee	6/10"	\$19.14		23	National Food
ROLLS, DINNER WHITE-RTS FROZEN	20 CS	16 EACH	HILLTOP HR	12/12/1.83 OZ	\$ 17.97	1330935	23	US Foods
STRAWBERRY RHUBARB PIE, BAKE & SRVE 1STQ	20 CS	6/46 OZ	CHEFPIERRE	6/46 OZ	\$ 29.10	8037202	23	US Foods
WAFFLES- AUNT JEMIMA OR =	20 CS	144/CS	mrsbutterworth		\$11.46	5454	23	ginsbergs
WAFFLES- MINI INDIVIDUAL WRAP-MICROWAVABLE CHILD NUT.	10 CS	72	PILLSBURY	72/2.47z	\$26.35	75924/69607	23	US Foods
BURRITO PORK FREE FULLY COOKED	200 CS	72/5 OZ	Packer	72/4 oz	28.83	5453762	24	SYSCO
BURRITO PORK FREE FULLY COOKED	200 CS	72/5 OZ	Good Source	72 / 5 oz	\$0.46 ea = \$33.20 cs	Varies	24	Good Source
CABBAGE ROLLS DRY PK READY TO COOK 5 OZ	40 CS	40/5 OZ	AWRDCS	4/12 CNT	\$58.80	F0950	24	REINHART
CABBAGE ROLLS FULL OKD W/ SAUCE CAMPBELL	10 CS	4/88 OZ	PRES/MOLLY	4/92 OZ	\$ 44.97	1326305	24	US Foods
KOSHER MEALS-FULLY COOKED-INDIVIDUALLY SEALED-SHELF STABL	60 CS	12/CS	Myownmeal	12/10 oz	\$38.84	80851	24	National Food
LASAGNA, CHEESE MEATLESS, FULLY COOKED	10 CS	4/6#	STOUFFERS	4 / 96 OZ	51.24	150410	24	Maines
MANICOTTI 4 INCH	10 CS	60 CT	Pedro	72 ct	24.60	7770734	24	SYSCO
OMELET, INDIV-PLAIN	50 CS	96/2 OZ	PAPTTI	84/3 OZ	\$42.19	B7934	24	REINHART
PIEROGIES, POTATO & CHEDDAR CHEESE FILL	30 CS	4/6.3#	Jackson County	14/1.65# bag	\$35.30	603566	24	National Food
PIEROGIES, POTATO & CHEDDAR CHEESE FILL	30 CS	4/6.3#	MRS T	4 / 6.3 LB	41.57	190504	24	Maines

POCKET BREAKFAST EGG/CHEESE/BACON	10 CS	32/5 oz	Good Source	48 / 4.5 oz	\$0.52 ea = \$24.96 CS	Varies	24	Good Source
POCKET SANDWICH PORK FREE CHEF AMERICA/=	150 CS	50/5 OZ	Good Source	48 / 4.5 oz	\$0.52 ea = \$24.96 CS	Varies	24	Good Source
POTATO, BAKED, STUFFED CHEDDAR RTS PEN/=	2 CS	48/CT	PENOBSCOT	50 / 5 OZ	29.40	184105	24	Maines
RAVIOLI CHEESE COOKED ROTANELLI OR =	50 CS	300/65	Rotanli		18.48	1314822	24	SYSCO
RAVIOLI MEAT-COOKED ROTANELLI OR =	25 CS	300 CT	ROSELI	2/5 LB	\$ 19.02	4329132	24	US Foods
STUFFED GREEN PEPPERS FULLY COOKED	3 CS	4/83 OZ	PRESIMOLLY	4/83 OZ	\$ 42.91	9326299	24	US Foods
STUFFED SHELLS, CHEESE 2.75 OZ EA	5 CS	96/2 OZ	Sicily	70/2.75 oz	21.16	7770755	24	SYSCO
TORTELLINI CHEESE COOKED ROTANELLI OR =	20 CS	4/3#	Redebro	12/1#	20.25	7820321	24	SYSCO
EGGS, SCRAMBLED FULLY COOKED-PAPPETTI OR	20 CS	8/2.5#	TrayRdy	8/2.5#	39.71	2541183	25	SYSCO
FROSTY THICK FRZ DESSERT, MIXED BERRY	10 CS	48/4 OZ	MAGIC CUP	48/4 OZ	\$ 33.87	5073077	25	US Foods
FROSTY THICK FRZ DESSERT, MIXED ORANGE	10 CS	48/4 OZ	hhl		\$28.80	27144	25	ginsbergs
MIGHTY SHAKE RTS STRAWBERRY-HORMEL/=	60 CS	75/4 OZ	RDYCAR	75/4 OZ	\$16.75	T1248	25	REINHART
MIGHTY SHAKE RTS CHOCOLATE NO ADDED SUG	20 CS	50/4 OZ	hhl		\$20.40	27479	25	ginsbergs
MIGHTY SHAKE RTS CHOCOLATE-HORMEL HLTH/=	75 CS	75/4 OZ	Imperial	75/4 oz	18.23	0104497	25	SYSCO
MIGHTY SHAKE RTS VANILLA NO ADDED SUGAR	30 CS	50/4 OZ	hhl		\$20.55	27488	25	ginsbergs
MIGHTY SHAKE RTS VANILLA-HORMEL HEALTH/=	60 CS	75/4	RDYCAR	75/4 OZ	\$16.75	T1240	25	REINHART
ASPARAGUS CUTS US GRADE A	10 CS	6/2.5lb	non partelle		\$27.15	94986	26	ginsbergs
AUTUMN MIX VEGUS GRADE A	10 CS	12/2#	Classic	6/4#	29.45	5549480	26	SYSCO
BEANS, GREEN ITALIAN STYLE US GRADE A	25 CS	12/2.5#	MONARCH	12/2 LB	\$ 15.50	1328269	26	US Foods
BEANS, GREEN, FRENCH CUT US GRADE A	25 CS	12/2#	MONARCH	12/2 LB	\$ 16.59	4328225	26	US Foods
BEANS, GREEN, SHORT CUT US GRADE A	50 CS	12/2#	non partelle		\$13.69	95095	26	ginsbergs
BEANS, GREEN, WHOLE SYSCO CLASSIC OR =	10 CS	12/2#	MONARCH	12/2 LB	\$ 16.73	5412887	26	US Foods
BEANS, WAX, CUT US GRADE A	50 CS	12/2#	MONARCH	12/2 LB	\$ 17.46	9328410	26	US Foods
BROCCOLI CUTS US GRADE A	120 CS	12/2.5#	NONPAREIL	1 / 12/2.5	17.98	013033	26	Maines
BROCCOLI FLORETS US GRADE A	50 CS	12/2#	NONPAREIL	1 / 12/2 LB	16.11	013032	26	Maines

BRUSSEL SPROUTS, MEDIUM US GRADE A	10 CS	12/2#	MONARCH	12/2.5 LB	\$ 26.84	8328536	26	US Foods
CALIFORNIA MIX US GRADE A	150 CS	12/2#	NONPAREIL	1 / 12/2 LB	18.08	013050	26	Maines
CARIBBEAN MIX VEGETABLES US GRADE A	45 CS	8/3 #	Classic	6/4#	30.76	5545801	26	SYSCO
CARROTS, DICED US GRADE B	150 CS	20#	reddy raw		\$9.25	95505	26	ginsbergs
CARROTS, SLICED US GRADE A	160 CS	12/2.5#	reddy raw	20#	\$9.40	95555	26	ginsbergs
CARROTS, WHOLE BABY US GRADE A	60 CS	3/10#	non parielle	12/2#	\$14.99	95590	26	ginsbergs
CAULIFLOWER US GRADE A	100 CS	12/2#	non parielle		\$15.75	95625	26	ginsbergs
CHATEAU BLEND VEGETABLES	10 CS	6/4#	CULSEC	6/4 LB	\$28.13	61150	26	REINHART
CORN, WHOLE KERNALUS GRADE A	110 CS	20#	HARVEST VL	20 LB	\$ 11.30	4328233	26	US Foods
COUNTRY MIXED VEG US GRADE A	10 CS	20#	BHRVST	12/2 LB	\$20.52	61162	26	REINHART
EGGPLANT CUTLET FIRST QUALITY	10 CS	10 LB	dominex		\$24.30	34196	26	ginsbergs
EMPEROR'S STIR FRY BLEND VEGETABLES	10 CS	6/4#	CULSEC	6/4 LB	\$28.00	61378	26	REINHART
ISLAND BLEND	10 CS	6/4#	CULSEC	6/4 LB	\$29.44	62190	26	REINHART
ITALIAN MIXED VEG US GRADE A	30 CS	20#	MONARCH	20 LB	\$ 17.01	8328296	26	US Foods
MIXED VEGETABLES US GRADE A	100 CS	3/10 #	REDVALLEY	20 LB	\$ 12.01	6784623	26	US Foods
MONTE CARLO BLEND VEGETABLES	10 CS	6/4#	Classic	6/4#	25.10	3533429	26	SYSCO
ONIONS, DICED US GRADE A	100 CS	20 LB	fine I		\$11.60	96231	26	ginsbergs
ONIONS, PEARL US GRADE A	2 CS	12/2#	FZHVST	12/2 LB	\$28.26	K5768	26	REINHART
ORIENTAL BLEND US GRADE A	15 CS	12/2#	MONARCH	20 LB	\$ 17.33	7328446	26	US Foods
PEAS AND PEARL ONIONS US GRADE A	30 CS	12/2.5#	MONARCH	12/2.5 LB	\$ 27.37	6328280	26	US Foods
PEAS, SNOW PODS	4 CS	12/2#	NONPAREIL	12 / 2#	25.87	147626	26	Maines
PEAS, SWEET 3-4 SV US GRADE A	150 CS	3/10#	HARVEST VL	20 LB	\$ 14.55	8328247	26	US Foods
PEPPERS, GREEN SLICED US GRADE A	10 CS	20#	Arcgard	20#	23.76	3421341	26	SYSCO
PEPPERS, GREEN SLICED US GRADE A	10 CS	20#	HONOR	12/2 LB	\$26.51	C0504	26	REINHART
PEPPERS, GREEN DICED US GRADE A	10 CS	12/2 LB	NONPAREIL	1 / 20 LB	15.88	013040	26	Maines

POTATO PUFFS HEAT/SERVE MAPCO OR =	60 CS	6/5#	oreida		\$17.98	97265	26	ginsbergs
POTATO PUFFS-SWEET POTATO--SWEET THINGS OR =	10 CS	6/2.5 #	mccains		\$19.98	97166	26	ginsbergs
POTATO WEDGES , SKIN ON	30 CS	6/5#	oreida		\$18.49	97050	26	ginsbergs
POTATOES FRENCH FRIES PRECOOKED BROWNED	25 CS	6/5#	HARVEST VL	6/4.5 LB	\$ 15.44	8327041	26	US Foods
ROMANO MIX US GRADE A	100 CS	12/2LB	Imperial	6/4#	25.69	1333186	26	SYSCO
SCANDINAVIAN VEGETABLES US GRADE A	10 CS	20#	MONARCH	6/4 LB	\$ 21.76	7327828	26	US Foods
SPINACH CHOPPED US GRADE A	80 CS	12/3#	Nonparl	12/3#	24.61	7146410	26	SYSCO
SQUASH, HUBBARD CKD US GRADE A TUBS PKD	40 CS	12/4#	HONOR	12/4 LB	\$32.85	B1420	26	REINHART
SQUASH, YELLOW SLICED US GRADE A	50 CS	12/2#	MONARCH	12/3 LB	\$ 28.59	9328063	26	US Foods
SQUASH, ZUCCINI SLICED US GRADE A	150 CS	12/2#	MONARCH	12/3 LB	\$ 27.26	6328397	26	US Foods
WINTER VEG MIX US GRADE A	30 CS	20#	MONARCH	20 LB	\$ 18.06	4328316	26	US Foods
BEEF PEPPER STEAK HEAT AND SERVE	10 CS	40/4 oz	Classic	40/4 oz	39.57	7097256	27	SYSCO
BEEF POT PIE BANQUET OR =	180 CS	24/7 OZ	BANQUET	24/7 OZ	\$ 18.59	5049937	27	US Foods
BEEF STEAK-UM'S PHILLY STYLE	20 CS	64/2.5 OZ	QKMAID	48/2 OZ	\$18.40	B6888	27	REINHART
BEEF STEAK-UM'S PHILLY STYLE	20 CS	64/2.5 OZ	Pierre	53/3 oz	\$19.90	600897	27	National Food
BEEF, CORNED, COOKED	100 LB	2/6#	Groebel	2/7#	4.609	9260068	27	SYSCO
BEEF, TOP RND, CHOICE FULLY CKD.MED.DONE	10 CS	Pound	MrsReeses	2/6#	3.800	8080459	27	SYSCO
BEEFTURKEY GARLIC SAUSAGE LINKS	30 CS	150/3.2 OZ	Gdsourc	150/3.2 oz	45.21	7411302	27	SYSCO
BEEFTURKEY/MOZZ CHEESE ITALIANO PATTY	30 CS	120/4 OZ	Gd source	120/4oz	58.11	3570710	27	SYSCO
CHUCK POT ROAST LOW SODIUM GEM FOODS OR =	10 CS	1/10# avg	Classic	1/10# avg	4.68	5485984	27	SYSCO
CRUMBLE--BEEF/HICKEN PRE COOKED	2000#	40# cs	Good Source	40 lbs.	\$1.62 lb. = \$64.79	EB1300	27	Good Source
HAMBURGER PATTY "PUB TYPE" PRCK PIERRE OR =	40 CS	40/4 OZ	maidrite	48/4 oz	43.62	7057140	27	SYSCO
HAMBURGER PATTY PRE-CKD BEEF/TURKEY	30 CS	160/2.1 OZ	Md Rite	136/2 oz	37.21	0363251	27	SYSCO
MEATBALLS ALL BEEF 1 OZ HEAT & SERVE	250 CS	160/1 OZ	Arezzo	160/1 oz	21.96	7673700	27	SYSCO
MEATBALLS ALL BEEF 1 OZ HEAT & SERVE Lower Sodium	250 CS	160/1 OZ	NFG	640/1 oz	\$67.80	601073	27	National Food

JUICE CRNBRY COCKTAIL IND HONEY CONSIST	250 CS	24/4 OZ	RDYCAR	48/4 OZ	\$15.89	39004	36	REINHART
JUICE CRNBRY COCKTAIL IND NECTAR CONSIS	270 CS	24/4 OZ	RDYCAR	48/4 OZ	\$15.74	38990	36	REINHART
JUICE ORANGE IND NECTAR CONSISTENCY	100 CS	24/4 OZ	hhl		\$8.95	27392	36	ginsbergs
JUICE ORANGE IND HONEY CONSISTENCY	100 CS	24/4 OZ	hhl		\$8.95	27390	36	ginsbergs
MILK 2% IND HONEY CONSISTENCY RESOURCE/=	160 CS	24/8 OZ	LYONS	24/8 OZ	\$17.02	H9514	36	REINHART
MILK 2% IND NECTAR CONSISTENCY RESOURCE/=	320 CS	24/8 OZ	RDYCAR	24/8 OZ	\$17.06	H9332	36	REINHART
WATER IND HONEY CNSTNCTY RESOURCE/=	100 CS	24/4 OZ	RDYCAR	48/4 OZ	\$14.28	38412	36	REINHART
WATER IND NECTAR CONSISTENCY RESRCE/=	30 CS	24/4 OZ	RDYCAR	48/4 OZ	\$14.07	38710	36	REINHART