

RFB-2017-047**Bid Title:** Copier, Fine & Other Papers**Contact:** Rachel Delanoy, Chris Heide**Opening Date:** Wednesday, June 21, 2017

BIDDERS - → → → → →	W.B. Mason	Cascade School Supplies	Paper Mart
Proposal - Signed & Duplicated	Y	Y	Y
Non-Collusion Bidding Certificates	Y	Y	Y
Insurance Acknowledgement	Y	Y	Y
Election Law Statement	Y	Y	Y
Gifts Statement	Y	Y	Y
Iranian Divestment Certification	Y	Y	Y
Bidders Check List	Y	Y	Y
W-9	Y	Y	Y
8 1/2 x 11", 20 lb. White Total Price:	\$2,540.40	\$3,024.00	\$2,562.00
8 1/2 x 14", 20 lb. White Total Price:	\$311.70	\$566.00	\$340.00
11" x 17", 20 lb. White Total Price:	\$194.64	\$732.80	\$214.00
Lines 4-23:	See Bid	See Bid	See Bid

PROPOSAL SHEET (Cont'd)

<u>Item</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Quantity Needed (Sheets)</u>	<u>Brand Proposed</u>	<u>Manufacturer</u>	<u>Sheets per Case</u>	<u>Case Price</u>	<u>Number of Cases</u>	<u>Total Price</u>
1.	8 ½" x 11", 20 lb. White	600,000	Mason Flagship	Boise	5,000	21.17	120	2,540.40
2.	8 ½" x 14", 20 lb. White	50,000	Mason Flagship	Boise	5,000	31.17	10	311.70
3.	11" x 17", 20 lb. White	20,000	Mason Flagship	Boise	2,500	24.33	8	194.64
4.	8 ½" x 11", 100 lb. White Cover, 100% Bright	6,000						
5.	8 ½" x 11", 110 lb. White Index	50,000	Exact Index	Nec nah	2,000	38.46	25	961.50
6.	8 ½" x 14", 110 lb. White Index	0						
7.	11" x 17", 110 lb. White Index	0						
8.	8 ½" x 11", 24 lb. 95% Brightness, 25% Cotton, Light Cockle, Not Recycled	5,000						
9.	8 ½" x 11", 70 lb. White Offset-Smooth Finish	40,000	Williamsburg	I.P.	4,000	38.10	10	381.00
10.	8 ½" x 14", 70 lb. White Offset-Smooth Finish	0						
11.	11" x 17", 70 lb. White Offset-Smooth Finish	40,000	Williamsburg	I.P.	2,000	40.60	20	812.00
12.	NCR, 2-Part Paper 8 ½" X 11" Reverse Collated	130,000						
13.	NCR, 2-Part Paper 8 ½" X 14" Reverse Collated	0						
14.	NCR, 3-Part Paper 8 ½" x 11" Reverse Collated	100,200						
15.	NCR, 3-Part Paper 8 ½" x 14" Reverse Collated	0						

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET AND AN EXACT, CLEAR DUPLICATE.

Copier Paper - Info Tech

PROPOSAL SHEET (Cont'd)

<u>Item</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Quantity Needed (Sheets)</u>	<u>Brand Proposed</u>	<u>Manufacturer</u>	<u>Sheets per Case</u>	<u>Case Price</u>	<u>Number of Cases</u>	<u>Total Price</u>
16.	NCR, 3-Part Paper 9" x 11", Superior, Laser Snap, Reverse Collated	0						
17.	NCR, 4-Part Paper, 8 1/2" x 11" Reverse Collated	50,000						
18.	NCR, 5-Part Paper 8 1/2" x 11" Straight Collated	0						
19.	Envelopes, 6 3/4 Regular, White Wove, Bond, Sub 24	0						
20.	Envelopes, #9 Regular, White Wove, Bond, Sub 24 Diagonal Seams	0						
21.	Envelopes, #9 Window, White Wove, Bond, Sub 24 Diagonal Seams	0						
22.	Envelopes, #10 Regular, White Wove, Bond, Sub 24 Diagonal Seams	0						
23.	Envelopes, #10 Window, White Wove, Bond, Sub 24 Diagonal Seams	90,000						

BIDDERS DO NOT HAVE TO BID ON ALL ITEMS

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET AND AN EXACT, CLEAR DUPLICATE.

Copier Paper - Info Tech

PROPOSAL SHEET (Cont'd)

<u>Item</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Quantity Needed (Sheets)</u>	<u>Brand Proposed</u>	<u>Manufacturer</u>	<u>Sheets per Case</u>	<u>Case Price</u>	<u>Number of Cases</u>	<u>Total Price</u>
1.	8 1/2" x 11", 20 lb. White <i>031903</i>	600,000	<i>Cascade</i>		<i>5,000</i>	<i>25.20</i>	<i>120</i>	<i>3,024.⁰⁰</i>
2.	8 1/2" x 14", 20 lb. White <i>031904</i>	50,000	<i>Cascade</i>		<i>5,000</i>	<i>56.⁶⁰</i>	<i>10</i>	<i>566.⁰⁰</i>
3.	11" x 17", 20 lb. White <i>031906</i>	20,000	<i>Cascade</i>		<i>2,500</i>	<i>91.⁶⁰</i>	<i>8</i>	<i>732.⁸⁰</i>
4.	8 1/2" x 11", 100 lb. White Cover, 100% Bright <i>NO BID</i>	6,000				—		
5.	8 1/2" x 11", 110 lb. White Index <i>NO BID</i>	50,000				—		
6.	8 1/2" x 14", 110 lb. White Index	0				—		
7.	11" x 17", 110 lb. White Index	0				—		
8.	8 1/2" x 11", 24 lb. 95% Brightness, 25% Cotton, Light Cockle, Not Recycled <i>NO BID</i>	5,000				—		
9.	8 1/2" x 11", 70 lb. White Offset- Smooth Finish <i>NO BID</i>	40,000				—		
10.	8 1/2" x 14", 70 lb. White Offset- Smooth Finish	0				—		
11.	11" x 17", 70 lb. White Offset- Smooth Finish <i>NO BID</i>	40,000				—		
12.	NCR, 2-Part Paper 8 1/2" X 11" Reverse Collated <i>NO BID</i>	130,000				—		
13.	NCR, 2-Part Paper 8 1/2" X 14" Reverse Collated	0				—		
14.	NCR, 3-Part Paper 8 1/2" x 11" Reverse Collated <i>NO BID</i>	100,200				—		
15.	NCR, 3-Part Paper 8 1/2" x 14" Reverse Collated	0				—		

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET AND AN EXACT, CLEAR DUPLICATE.

Copier Paper - Info Tech

PROPOSAL SHEET (Cont'd)

<u>Item</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Quantity Needed (Sheets)</u>	<u>Brand Proposed</u>	<u>Manufacturer</u>	<u>Sheets per Case</u>	<u>Case Price</u>	<u>Number of Cases</u>	<u>Total Price</u>
16.	NCR, 3-Part Paper 9" x 11", Superior, Laser Snap, Reverse Collated	0				—		
17.	NCR, 4-Part Paper, 8 1/2" x 11" Reverse Collated <i>NO BID</i>	50,000				—		
18.	NCR, 5-Part Paper 8 1/2" x 11" Straight Collated	0				—		
19.	Envelopes, 6 3/4 Regular, White Wove, Bond, Sub 24	0				—		
20.	Envelopes, #9 Regular, White Wove, Bond, Sub 24 Diagonal Seams	0				—		
21.	Envelopes, #9 Window, White Wove, Bond, Sub 24 Diagonal Seams	0				—		
22.	Envelopes, #10 Regular, White Wove, Bond, Sub 24 Diagonal Seams	0				—		
23.	Envelopes, #10 Window, White Wove, Bond, Sub 24 Diagonal Seams <i>sold per box of 500 120343</i>	90,000	<i>Standard Envelope</i>		<i>2,500</i>	<i>40.40</i>	<i>36</i>	<i>1454.40</i>

Price/case

BIDDERS DO NOT HAVE TO BID ON ALL ITEMS

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET AND AN EXACT, CLEAR DUPLICATE.

Paper Mart Inc
6/26/17

PROPOSAL SHEET (Cont'd)

<u>Item</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Quantity Needed (Sheets)</u>	<u>Brand Proposed</u>	<u>Manufacturer</u>	<u>Sheets per Case</u>	<u>Case Price</u>	<u>Number of Cases</u>	<u>Total Price</u>
1.	8 1/2" x 11", 20 lb. White 5501022	600,000	Executive	Ledesma	5000	21.35	120	2562.00
2.	8 1/2" x 14", 20 lb. White 5745010	50,000	Spectrum	GP	5000	34.00	10	340.00
3.	11" x 17", 20 lb. White 5745015	20,000	Spectrum	GP	2500	26.75	8	214.00
4.	8 1/2" x 11", 100 lb. White Cover, 100% Bright 5797025	6,000	Finch Colocopy	Finch	1500	69.00	4	268.00
5.	8 1/2" x 11", 110 lb. White Index 7609010	50,000	Earth Choice	Domtar	2000	38.15	25	953.75
6.	8 1/2" x 14", 110 lb. White Index	0						
7.	11" x 17", 110 lb. White Index	0						
8.	8 1/2" x 11", 24 lb. 95% Brightness, 25% Cotton, Light Cockle, Not Recycled 5301010	5,000	Atlas	Neenah	5000	100.00	1	100.00
9.	8 1/2" x 11", 70 lb. White Offset-Smooth Finish 6803012	40,000	Husky	Domtar	4000	37.70	10	377.00
10.	8 1/2" x 14", 70 lb. White Offset-Smooth Finish	0						
11.	11" x 17", 70 lb. White Offset-Smooth Finish 6803019	40,000	Husky	Domtar	2000	40.00	20	800.00
12.	NCR, 2-Part Paper 8 1/2" X 11" Reverse Collated 6050001	130,000	Nekoosa Universal	Nekoosa	5000	63.25	26	1644.50
13.	NCR, 2-Part Paper 8 1/2" X 14" Reverse Collated	0						
14.	NCR, 3-Part Paper 8 1/2" x 11" Reverse Collated 6050005	100,200	Nekoosa Universal	Nekoosa	5000	70.10	60	4206.00
15.	NCR, 3-Part Paper 8 1/2" x 14" Reverse Collated	0						

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET AND AN EXACT, CLEAR DUPLICATE.

Copier Paper - Info Tech

Papermaster Inc
6/20/17

PROPOSAL SHEET (Cont'd)

Item	Description	Quantity Needed (Sheets)	Brand Proposed	Manufacturer	Sheets per Case	Case Price	Number of Cases	Total Price
16.	NCR, 3-Part Paper 9" x 11", Superior, Laser Snap, Reverse Collated	0						
17.	NCR, 4-Part Paper, 8 1/2" x 11" Reverse Collated 6050009	50,000	Nekoosa Universal	Nekoosa	5000	76.15	10	761.50
18.	NCR, 5-Part Paper 8 1/2" x 11" Straight Collated	0						
19.	Envelopes, 6 3/4 Regular, White Wove, Bond, Sub 24	0						
20.	Envelopes, #9 Regular, White Wove, Bond, Sub 24 Diagonal Seams	0						
21.	Envelopes, #9 Window, White Wove, Bond, Sub 24 Diagonal Seams	0						
22.	Envelopes, #10 Regular, White Wove, Bond, Sub 24 Diagonal Seams	0						
23.	Envelopes, #10 Window, White Wove, Bond, Sub 24 Diagonal Seams 891040	90,000	Printmaster	Cenveo	2500	40.95	36	1474.20

BIDDERS DO NOT HAVE TO BID ON ALL ITEMS

BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT THIS ORIGINAL SHEET AND AN EXACT, CLEAR DUPLICATE.

Copier Paper - Info Tech