

RFB-2016-093

Bid Title: Copier, Fine & Other Papers

Contact: Rachel Delanoy

Opening Date: Wednesday, December 07, 2016

<b>BIDDERS - → → → → →</b>	<b>W.B. Mason</b>	<b>Paper Mart</b>	<b>Salsa Professional Apparel &amp; Supplies</b>	<b>Veritiv</b>
<b>Proposal - Signed &amp; Duplicated</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>
<b>Non-Collusion Bidding Certificates</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>
<b>Insurance Acknowledgement</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>
<b>Election Law Statement</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>
<b>Gifts Statement</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>
<b>Iranian Divestment Certification</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>
<b>Bidders Check List</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>
<b>W-9</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>	<b>Y</b>

<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Total Price</b>			
<b>1</b>	<b>8 ½" x 11", 20 lb. White</b>	<b>\$1,810.40</b>	<b>\$1,838.40</b>	<b>\$2,870.40</b>	<b>\$2,396.80</b>
<b>2</b>	<b>8 ½" x 14", 20 lb. White</b>	<b>\$624.40</b>	<b>\$696.00</b>	<b>\$980.40</b>	<b>\$876.80</b>
<b>3</b>	<b>11" x 17", 20 lb. White</b>	<b>\$493.80</b>	<b>\$545.00</b>	<b>\$772.80</b>	<b>\$647.20</b>
<b>9</b>	<b>8 ½" x 11", 70 lb. White Offset-Smooth Finish</b>	<b>\$381.00</b>	<b>\$373.90</b>	<b>\$420.00</b>	<b>\$454.40</b>
<b>11</b>	<b>11" x 17", 70 lb. White Offset-Smooth Finish</b>	<b>\$812.00</b>	<b>\$395.90</b>	<b>\$898.50</b>	<b>\$956.00</b>
<b>12</b>	<b>NCR, 2-Part Paper 8 ½" X 11" Reverse Collated</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$1,280.00</b>	<b>\$4,560.00</b>	<b>\$2,988.00</b>
<b>18</b>	<b>NCR, 5-Part Paper 8 ½" x 11" Straight Collated</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$797.50</b>	<b>\$9,720.00</b>	<b>\$1,850.90</b>
<b>22</b>	<b>Envelopes, #10 Regular, White Wove, Bond, Sub 24 Diagonal Seams</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$1,346.00</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$1,660.00</b>