

BID TITLE: LEASE TO OWN GOLF COURSE GROUNDS EQUIPMENT

BID NUMBER: 2014-016

BID OPENING: WEDNESDAY, MARCH 19, 2014

DEPARTMENT: EN-JOIE



BIDDERS NAME:	Grassland Equipment	MTE Turf Equipment	Andre & Son	Cazenovia Equipment	J J Equipment
Proposal Signed & Duplicated?	yes	yes	yes	yes	
Variation & Justification Sheet included?	yes	yes	yes	yes	
Non-Collusive Bidding Certificate Signed?	yes	yes	yes	yes	
Election Law Statement Completed & Signed?	yes	yes	yes	yes	
Gift Statement Completed & Signed?	yes	yes	yes	yes	
Bidders Checklist Completed & Signed?	yes	yes	yes	yes	
Insurance Acknowledgement Signed?	yes	yes	yes	yes	
Insurance Certificate Enclosed?					
W-9 Completed & Signed?	yes	yes	yes	yes	
#1 Lightweight Fairway Mower:	Ford 500 Toro #2 03670 2014 30 Delivery in Days: Annual Payment: Total Payment over lease for 5 years:	Newbosc Tech Flyer 68011 2014 60 19,406 31 97,631	Buesess LM2480 2013 30 16,274 30 81,387	John Deere 1500 Precision 2014 60 4476 15,881 44 79,307	NO BID
#2 Rough Fairway Mower w/attachments:	Manufacturer: Model #:	Vermeer 39.5/208	n/a	n/a	NO BID

BIDDERS NAME:  

	Grassland Equipment	MTE Turf Equipment	Andre & Son	Cazenovia Equipment	J J Equipment
#2 Rough Fairway Mower w/attachments: Model year: _____ Delivery in Days: _____ Annual Payment: _____ Total Payment over lease for 5 years: _____		2014 40 4,957.85 39,489.64			NO BID
#3 Walk Behind Sod Cutter: Manufacturer: _____ Model #: _____ Model year: _____ Delivery in Days: _____ Annual Payment: _____ Total Payment over lease for 5 years: _____	N/B	Ryan 544951H 2014 60 930.29 4,651.45	N/B	N/B	NO BID
#4 Hydraulic Rear Dump Trailer: Manufacturer: _____ Model #: _____ Model year: _____ Delivery in Days: _____ Annual Payment: _____ Total Payment over lease for 5 years: _____	N/B	Theverie DTC08 2014 60 1,691.25 8,358.75	N/B	Cam 5EAM610 DOD 2014 60 3,158.61 44	NO BID
TRADE IN: 2 - Reelmaster 5210 Fairway Mowers Trade-in:	7,070.00 7,070.00 14,070.00	7,900.00 15,800.00	19,000.00 19,000.00	4,300.00 19,600.00	NO BID