RFB-2016-101

Bid Title: Purchase of Plow Blades/ Shoes & Salt Spreader Chains
Contact: John Sullivan - Highway

Opening Date: Wednesday, December 14, 2016

Expanded

BIDDERS - = > > > Chemung Steel Sales Winter Supply Valle_:y I_3Iades Five Star
Supply Limited Equipment
Products
Proposal - Signed & Duplicated Y Y Y Y Y
14-21 days
Delivery (# of days) 21 14 (6 weeks for steel BLANK 21
plow blades)

Non-Collusion Bidding Certificates Y Y Y Y

Insurance Acknowledgement Y Y Y Y No Bid
Election Law Statement Y Y Y Y Y

Gifts Statement Y Y Y Y Y

Iranian Divestment Certification Y Y Y Y Y

W-9 Y Y Y Y BLANK




RFB-2016-101
Plow Blades/ Shoes Salt Spreader Chains

Item # Description Chemung Supply Steel Sales Winter Equipment Expz;nr(iziftl;pply
Steel Snow Plow Blade Edges: 17 x 8” x 5” Surface Equivalent Manufacturer: Evolution Edges Black Cat Valk
hardened or flame hardened

1 Only — 7 hole  reversible — punched for /8" plow Pat# | EPBTPSCA-20901 PBB8806049 ESP185
bolts on 3” — 3” — 12” centers
— Pacal #P8849501 or equal Unit / Each Price: $95.55 $111.00 $114.46* $130.68
Steel Snow Plow Blade Edges: 17 x 8” x 6’ Surface Equivalent Manufacturer: Evolution Edges Black Cat Valk
hardened or flame hardened
2 Only — 8 hole — reversible — punched for 78" plow
Part # PBB8807249
bolts on 3” — 3” — 12” centers EPBTPSCA-20902 ESP186
— Pacal #P8849601 or equal ; -
Unit / Bach Price: $114.66 $133.00 $137.35* $157.64
Carbide Insert Blade: ¥4 x 6” x 4’ -6 hole — Manufacturer: Evolution Edges Winter Equipment Valk
3 punched for 78 plow bolts on 3”7 — 3”7 — 127 Part# | ECBTPSQA-21480 CB3041522 ESP3/464
centers Unit / Each Price: $173.56 $170.00 $179.07 $163.64
Carbide Insert Blade: ¥4” x 6” x 3’ -5 hole - Manufacturer: Evolution Edges Winter Equipment Valk
4 punched for 78" plow bolts on 37 — 37 — 12 Part# | ECBTPSQA-21360 CB3031522 ESP3/463
centers Unit / Each Price: $130.17 $127.50 $238.76 $122.73
(Price Per Foot)
Spreader Chains: pintle link: 667X, bar flight: Widths:
5 37 x 1 147, bar flight location: every other link, a. 20 ¥2” center to center: $25.50 $24.50 NO BID $23.75
bar flight to be double welded at each end b. 217 center to center: $25.50 $24.50 NO BID $23.75
c. 21 1/16” center to center: $25.50 $24.50 NO BID $23.75
d. 21 ¥4” center to center: $25.50 $24.50 NO BID $23.75
Spreader Chains: pintle link: D88K, bar flight: (Price Per Foot)
6 %87 x 1 ¥4, bar flight location: every other link, Widths: $26.32 $29.50 NO BID $28.00
bar flight to be double welded at each end 20” center to center:
7 Snow Plow Shoes: Moldboard
Attach price list if
8 Snow Plow Shoes: Wing Shoe (8 & 12: combo offering discount
centers) Moldboard from list.
20.0% See Attached 20-30% NO BID
9 Frame Shoe-one way State Percentage:
] %
10 Nosepiece

*: 6 week delivery




RFB-2016-101
Plow Blades/ Shoes Salt Spreader Chains

_— Valley Blades Five Star
Item # Description o .
P Limited Equipment
Steel Snow Plow Blade Edges: 17 x 8” x 5” Surface Equivalent Manufacturer: Va”?y Elades
hardened or flame hardened Limited
1 Only — 7 hole — reversible — punched for 78" plow Part # 1860WVESE NO BID
bolts on 3” — 3” — 12” centers
— Pacal #P8849501 or equal Unit / Each Price: $150.00
Steel Snow Plow Blade Edges: 17 x 8” x 6” Surface Equivalent Manufacturer: Vallgy B|ad€S
hardened or flame hardened Limited
2 Only — 8 hole — reversible — punched for 78" plow Part # NO BID
bolts on 3” — 3” — 12” centers 1872WVFSE
— Pacal #P8849601 or equal ; -
Unit / Each Price: $180.00
Manufacturer: Valley Blades
Carbide Insert Blade: ¥4” x 6” x 4> -6 hole — anutacturer- Limited
3 A o m 1o Part #: NO BID
punched for 75 plow bolts on 3” — 37 — 12 art #: 34648WPTSB
centers Unit / Each Price: $170.00
Manufacturer Valley Blades
Carbide Insert Blade: ¥4” x 6” x 3’ -5 hole - anutacturer: Limited
4 5/ o am_ o Part #: NO BID
punched for 78" plow bolts on 3” — 3" — 12 art #: 34636WPTSB
centers Unit / Each Price: $127.50
(Price Per Foot)
Spreader Chains: pintle link: 667X, bar flight: Widths:
5 37 x 1 147, bar flight location: every other link, a. 20 ¥2” center to center: $28.00 NO BID
bar flight to be double welded at each end b. 217 center to center: $28.00
c. 21 1/16” center to center: $28.00
d. 21 Y27 center to center: $28.00
Spreader Chains: pintle link: D88K, bar flight: (Price Per Foot)
6 %87 x 1 ¥4, bar flight location: every other link, Widths: $28.00 NO BID
bar flight to be double welded at each end 20” center to center:
7 Snow Plow Shoes: Moldboard
Attach price list if
8 Snow Plow Shoes: Wing Shoe (8 & 12: combo offering discount
centers) Moldboard i
) from list. 25.0% NO BID
9 Frame Shoe-one way State Percentage:
] %
10 Nosepiece

*: 6 week delivery
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